COMPILATION
OF

NATIONAL PARK SERVICE LAWS

109TH CONGRESS

January 2005 to December 2006




UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

DIRK KEMPTHORNE, Secretary
NATIONAL PARK SERVICE
MARY BOMAR, Director

COMPILATION OF
NATIONAL PARK SERVICE LAWS
109™ CONGRESS

January 2005 to December 2006

WASHINGTON: 2007




FOREWORD

~ This compilation includes all laws enacted by the 109 Congress (2005-2006)
that affect the National Park Service. We have included both park bills passed
individually, as well as any legislation concerning national parks that was included
in appropriations bills. In each case, we have noted in the index the specific section
of the act where the language can be found.

The text used for each public law is the same version as is found in the United
States Statutes at Large. A line of stars in the text denotes omitted, extraneous
material.

In addition to the public laws, this compilation includes copies of any
presidential proclamations and executive orders that affect the National Park
Service.

We appreciate the assistance of LaTonya Ward in compiling these laws. If you
have any questions, please feel free to contact us.

Tom Wolfe Donald J. Hellmann
Assistant Director Deputy Assistant Director/
Legislative and Congressional Affairs Chief of Legislation

Legislative and Congressional Affairs




TABLE OF CONTENTS
NATIONAL PARK SERVICE LAWS 2005—2006 '
: 109™ Congress
L General Legl slation: . §
- 1. Competitive Sourcing, Sec. 422 Title TV, P.L. 109-54 ................ cereereesessaesaniinse P 78
2. Fee Authority, Sec. 132, Title I, P.L. 109-54.........coeovvmmeeernn.. ettt seaes 75
3. Historic Preservation _ oo . ‘
(a) Sec. 101, Title I, P.L. 109-135 ...ooovrrrvrrerrmrrrrrarnne. SSVTRIURTIRI. X .
(D) PL. 109453 ..ot sssssssseeeennessnese s rrraererersenssaeseans 537
4, Land and Water Conservation Fund, Sec. 105, Title I, Division C, P.L. 109-432...... 521
5. Lighthouse Preservation, Sec. 501, Title V, P.L. 109-241 .........cccccooiivemnrrrsinrsnrerernnnns 385
6. National Park System Advisory Board, Sec. 5, P.L. 109-156 ........ rrresis sty 360
7. Overflights of National Parks, Sec. 177, Title I, P.L. 109~115....‘ .................... eeereraees 323
8. Transportation Authorities: o p L
T (@) PLU109-1 st sensss s s eestt e et 6
(0) P.L. 10920 ettt 19
(€) P.L.109-35....ceeeeeeerereeree et ernens JES reeresueerreeereenae 32
(@) PL. 10940, st secsesennas v RS |
(€) P.L.109-42 . coorveerrecns ervuesssesenessetastny et s s s e esvenesis e 60
() P.L.109-59 ....riiiirnnnenraionsiencnsnannns eerret gt berea et e rares 154
(8) Sec. 144, Admin. Provision, Title I, P.L. 109-115....rrveeeooveeseeereoeessee v 321
(h) Sec. 1302, Title X1, P.L. 109-280........ccce.c..... Ceereereee e ieae e ssaesaes e neresanes 395
II. Appropriations: L -
1. Department of Agriculture Appropriations for FY 2006, P.L. 109-97.........cc.ccovoee. 316
2. Department of Defense Appropriations for FY 2006, P.L. 109-148 ..........cc.cceomsnnunn. 342
3. Department of the Interior Appropriations for FY 2006, P.L..109-54 ................... e 67
4. Department of Transportation Appropriations for FY 2006,.P.L. 109-115................. 320
5. Emergency Supplemental Appropriations for FY 2005, P.L. 109-13 ......cc.oooevreneen. 1
6. Emergency Supplemental Appropriations for FY 2006, P.L. 109-234 ............ erarneenen 378
M.  National Parks: S R
1. Channel Islands, Sec. 1077, T1tleX P.L. 109 364 ........................... seeseenriensae e sanarnsaes 495
2. Glacier, Sec. 1302, Title XIII, P.L. 109-280........cccceemmmernerirrerirereeeieeceeeeeenessnsnsses 395
3. Great Basin, Sec. 382, Subtitle H, Title III, Div. C, P.L. 109-432 ........ covenesisseiennnenes 325
- 4. Great Smoky Mountains, Sec. 132, Title L, P.L. 109-54 ...........c.ccoiivinnimncecninnns 75
5. Kenai Fjords, Sec. 438, Title IV, P.L. 109-54 .......ooouooeoereeeeomreerrreresreesrr. SR 81
6. Mt. Rainier, NPS, Construction, Title I, P.L. 109-54........................... ereenrena et 69
7. Redwood: 7 . SRS
(@) Title T, P.L. 109-13 1 cumiveceeseeeeneeeeceseeeeeeresenseneeeeseeseeeesseseemesrmses s s seenes 333
(B) Sec. 10, P.L. 109-362....ccuvmriiiiriirernenrneesiesteerseevenersssessessversesssssensssssssessssens 487
i




8. Rocky Mountain: o ‘
(@) Private Law 109-1 ..ot nsss s ss st esnens 539
(b) P.L. 109-93......oreeerceerreimernnecreesenessscsennesesens sereenone brereraneare e esetenaestenennsesertas 314
9. Wind Cave, P.L. 109-T1 .......ooorreererereereenisessanirionsesensesssssessesssessessssesssmssssssssmsensasesssss 312
10. Yellowstone:
() Sec. 6032, P.L. 109-13 ...ccvreerrereirnecrscsmnseamresestesssssssssssessssessnssssrasssnsassrasanes 3
(b) Sec. 126, General Provisions, P.L. 109-54 ...... rersresasineens ..... IS
1L Yosemlte, Title I, P.L. 109—131 ....... JRORSIR N SOR VSN SRS S e heeriereesssrasassene 330
IV.  National Historical Parks: , ) o
" 1. Kalaupapa, Sec.'128, Title [, P.L. 109-54.........ccc0oe0.e.. eerrresersanes cerenrerigeare s s s aresas 74
" 2. Minute Man, PL. 109419 s SO 513
V Natlonal Historic Sites: ‘ P e e e
1. Lincoln Home, Sec. 132, Tltlel P.L. 109 T SR SRR, SN e 75
2. Little Rock Central High School, P.L. 109-146 ........ % .ceercecrcne e i 339
3. Sand Creek Massacre, P.L. 109-85..occrrcrcrsd Lo SO .~
VI.  National Memorials and Memorial Parks - S
* 1. Benjamin Franklin, P.L. 109-153 ........iivemeionecmnsiumessmmsscasasssssisssssinsiossiostasismscssensases 352
2. Eisenhower, P.L. 109-220 .....c.irsinmrerssseseres s ieeriasmssasmesersess ssossssisssssssssssasasonss 375
3. Martin Luther King Jr., Sec. 134, Gen. Provisions, T1tleI PL 109-54....ccrevrrevene, 75
4, Mt. Soledad Veterans, P.L. 109-272 ................ 389
5. Ukraine Famine, P.L. 109-340 ........... SO S RS et 485
6. USS Arizona, Sec. 1017, Subtitle B, Title XP.L. 109-163 e, elrerrerr e ereanrraes 367
VII.  National Monuments: ' : ’
’ 1. Afncan Burial Ground Proclamatlon 7984 EH SOOI S e 341
VIIL - Natlonal Seashores/Lakeshores L S ' ¢
1. Apostle Islands, Sec. 799, Title VIL, P.L. 109 97 ..... eeeeereteernenneas cebireerarenians 319
2. Cape Lookout, P.L. 109- 117 ............... e nanereees 325
3. GulfIstands: - ” S
(2) Sec. 6034, P.L. 109-13 ......ocorrerernieesiscorsssosisesonssiaessssssnsacsssisnesens PN 4
(b) Sec. 2872, Subtitle E, Title XXVIII, PL 109-163 ... XU i 372
~* 4. Padre Island, Sec. 373, P.L. 109-58............ S SR P — SRS & ) |
IX.  National Recreation Areas: S : o '
1. Delaware Water Gap, P.L. 109 156 e, OO LOPN ORI R L |
2. Golden Gate: e ' -
(a) Sec. 131, Title |, P.L. 109-54 .................. rerere et snes erreressens oo 74
(b) Title II, P.L. 109-131 .t revtreerenisatesons eeeretenennes 332
- 1

ii




X.

_ Natlonal Parkways: . ,
1. Blue Ridge, Sec. 799, Title VII P.L.109-97...... irenr et et r s s e 318
National Cap1tal Parks -
.- L Federal and District of Columbia Real Property Convcyance P.L. 109 396....., ......... 500
2. Jackson Place, Madison Place, and Penn. Ave., _ , ) .

) . Admin. Provisions, NPS, Title [, P.L. 109-54 ........cccooimmeeeeneiereecaleneeestssee s 70
3. John F. Kennedy Center, P.L. 109-306..........occcoeeeeeivrcrrerecr e ecetesnevennns eenrrneenea 397
4. Law Enforcement Officers Memorial, P.L. 109-314......................... beneenerreneeseeneenioens 398
National Trails System:

1. Captain John Smith:
(@) P.L. 109418t e e et s s senend ieebuereeners P 1 § I
(b) Sec. 133, Title I, P.L. 109-54 ...t rrsenressressvsrssserssesrsnssnee 75
. 2. New Jersey Coastal Heritage, Sec. 703, Title VII P.L.:109-338 ......... rererneaenenaas ... 481.
3. Trail of Tears (study), P.L. 109-378 .................... esreresebies e e st s e s nee et asamaesrneenanesaesene 498
. National Heritage Areas: : | -
1. Arabia Mountain, Subtitle C, thle II PL. 109 338 .................................................... 417
2. Atchafalaya, Subtitle B, Title II, P.L. 109-338.........cccrvriverrirrrvcinririeereeeeeeereeceeees 413

.3. Champlain Vailey, Subtitle G, Title I, P.L. 109-338......ccpuninirrpirasirssriannns —_
4. Crossroads of the American Revolutlon, Subtitle J, Title I, P.L.109-338 .......... o459
5. Freedom's Frontier, Subtitle E, Title I, P.L. 109-338 .......ocuvieereeer e eereeeeeseeeesens 429
6. Great Basin, Subtitle H, Title I, P.L. 109-338 .......c..coovreireceeececereveercnneennsrens 446
7. Gullah/Geechee, Subtitle I, Title I P.L. 109-338 e ovvvmeoeeoeoeeeeoeeoeoeeoeeeeesseseneeesos 454
8. Illinois & Michigan Canal, Title IV, P.L. 109-338.......c.ccccoortmnmrirrmierinr e e 472
9. John H. Chafee Blackstone River Valley, Title VI, P.L. 109-338 ...........ccccooecnuuecce.. 479
10. Mormon Pioneer, Subtitle D, Title I, P.L. 109-338......coveernrereeeerreeoreerecmessemesennne. 422
11. National Coal, Title IX, P.L. 109-338 ......cccovrrrrcnnriienans eresersenbens e neanaeneas 484
12. National Heritage Areas Act of 2006 P.L.109-338 ..o I 405
13. Northern Rio Grande, Subtitle A, Title I, P.L. 109-338......c.ccvvtviveeirrerceseeeeene 409
14. Upper Housatonic Valley, Subtitle F, Title I, P.L. 109-338..............ccouvvrrvcnneneen. 435
15. Southern Campaign of the Revolutlon (study), Subtitle C, Title II, P. L. 109-338... 470

" 16. St. Croix (study), Subtitle B, Title I, P.L. 109-338 ........ocouermeemreeereeerereeeseereennne 469
17. Western Reserve (study), Subtitle A, Title III, P.L. 109-338 .......ccocorevcieoreienee 467
18. Yuma Crossing, P.L. 109-318 ..o etscresr v s et nnn 402
XIV. Wild and Scenic Rivers:
1. Famington River and Salmon Brook, P.L. 109-370........ccoorecvercrereersensisnons 497
2. Musconetcong, P.L. 109-452.......co e eecren e snee s seeestes sessssssassssasesssnes 533
Miscellaneous Enactments:

XX

1. Angel Island Immigration Station, P.L. 109-119........cccmeeeeceeecreeeeeres e 326




Battle of Frankin (study), P.L. 109-120 ....ovcessemreerresmmsecesscasescrsessimenssonsssssessessnsssose 328

2.
3. Buffalo Soldiers Memorial, P.L. 109-152....cccoeiriicmrnncnne SOV RO SO, v 350
- 4. Castle Nugent Farms, St. Croix (study), Title VI, P.L. 109-317 ooneeieeeciienieemeasssanerenees 400
5. Delaware National Coastal (study), Title VI, P.L. 109-338 ... 477
6. Energy Supplies and Energy Rights-of-Way, P.L. 109-58 el lrehre bennd e ecnsnnsensennns 83
7. Japanese American Confinement Sites; P.L: 109-441............ dreeanriesiessesenesrendesesnsaerentanes 530
8. Lewis & Clark Coin Bicentennial Commemorative Coin, P. L 109—232......;..’.; ..... reneee- 376
9. Michigan Maritime Sites (study), P.L. 109-436. .............. everereeliaseireaarasassenaassnsssrasseasane 528
' 10. River Raisin (study), P.L. 109-429........... eestereeeane e enseenees -..'..-....;....'..-."."..'.2'..'.:....." ....... 515
- 11. Ste. Genevieve County, MO (study), P.L. 109:319.......00.0ceieemrieeenrrrnsesien s 403
12. Service First Initiative, Sec. 428, Title I, P.L. 109-54 .....cccovnvinnisivnnmivnisnsnisrcssonans 79
13. Youth Conservation Corps, Sec. 2, P.L. 109-154.......comrniunmrmsmecsiveessivnsiiionerenineesnnn: 353

EXECUTIVE ORDERS, January 20, 2005-December 31 2006 o

E.O. 13371 -1/27/2005 " Amendments to EO 13285, -Relating to the' Pre51dent s- Council on
- : -Service and Civic Participation:................iiveesiivvcnivevurnennens 556

E.O. 13385 9/29/2005  Continuance of Certain Federal Advisory Committees and Amendments

to and Revocation of Other Executlve Orders..- ....... it 558
- .o . " . (AR . '
E.O.13389 11/ 1/2005 - - Establishment of a Coordmator of federal Support for the Recovery and
o Rebulldlng of the Gulf Coast Reglon. PP TIPS 561
E.O. 13392 12/14/2005 Improving Agency DlSClOSUIe of Informatlon. ceean ceraaenage ..563
E.O. 13401 4/27/2006 - Responsibilities of Federal Departments and Agcncws w1th Respect to
: - Volunteer Commumty Serv:ce. RSO S S FESVRT 568
E.Q. 13406 6/23/2006 - Protectmg Property nghts of the Amencan People. el Seses ..... 570
Appendix I R "
Establishment of the Northwest Hawaiian Islands Marme Nat:ona.l Monument .
- Proclamatlon 8031 ............ SR R ST TSNS 8 ecrsennirnrnaerioens O45
.5

v




PUBLIC LAW 109-13—MAY 11, 2005 * 119 STAT. 231

Public Law 109-13
109th Congress
An Act

Making Emergency Supplsmental Appropnahons fm- Defense, the Global War on-
Terror, and Teunami Relief, for the fiscal year endmg September 30 2005 and”

for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatwes of

the United States of America in Congress assembled

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. °

This Act may be- cited as the “Emergency Supplemental Appro-
htlfogz 0A5?’t for Defense, the Global War on Terror, and Tsunami
e i R

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CON'I‘ENTS
The table of contents for this Act is as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title.
Sec. 2. Table of contents.
Sec. 3. References.

DIVISION A—EMERGENCY SUPPLEMENTAL APPROFRIATIONS FOR
DEFENSE, THE GLOBAL WAR ON TERROR, AND TSUNAMI RELIEF, 2005

Title I—Defense Related Appropriations ]
Title H—Int'ia‘rnational Programs and Assistance for Reconstruction and the War on

Title IN—Domestic Appropriations for the War on Termr
Title IV—Indian OQcean Tsunami Relief

Title V—Other Emergency Appropriations

Title VI—General Provisions and Technical Corrections

DIVISION B—REAL ID ACT OF 2005

SEC. 3. REFERENCES,

Except as expressly Elrowded otherwise, any reference to “this
Act” contained in any division of this Act s be treated as
referring only to the provisions of that division. ’ ‘

DIVISION  A—EMERGENCY SUPPLE-
MENTAL APPROPRIATIONS ACT FOR
DEFENSE, THE GLOBAL WAR ON TER-
ROR, AND TSUNAMI RELIEF, 2005

That the followmg ‘sums are appropriated; out of any money in

the Treasury not otherwise appropriated, for the fiscal year ending

September 30, 2005, and for other purposes, namely '
* * * *

May 11, 2005
[H.R. 1268]

Emerpgency
Supplemental

, Appropriations

Act for Defense,
the Global War
on Terror, and
Tsunami Relief,
2005,

Emerge
Supplemﬁtal
riations
Act for Defense,
the Global War
on Terror, and
Tsunami Ralief,
2005. .




" PUBLIC LAW 109-13—MAY 11, 2005 .~ ."'119 STAT. 281

For an additional amount for “Housing for Pergons with Disabil-
ities”, $238,080,000, to remain available until September 30, 2006:
Provided, That these funds shall be available under the same terms
and conditions as authorized for funds under this heading in Public

Law 108447
OFFICE OF FEPERAL HoUSING ENTERPRISE OVERSIGHT
SALARIES AND EXPENSES C e
(INCLUDIRG TRANSFER OF FUNDS) ean g s

For an additional amount for the “Office of Federal Housing
Enterprise Oversight” for carrying out the Federal Housing Enter- .
prises . Financial Safoty and Soundness Act of 1992, $5,000,000
to remain available until expended, to be derived from the Federal
Housing Enterprises Oversight Fund but not any funds collected )
under section 1316(c) of the Federal Housing Enterprises Financials- ™
Safety and Soundness Act of 1992 (12 U.S.C. 4516(c)): Provided, ‘::
That notwithstanding section 1316(d) of the Federal Housing Enter- . ...
prises Financial Safety and Soundness Act of 1992, any funds =~~~
collected under section 1316(c) of the Federsl Housing Enterprises
Financial Safety and Soundness Act of 1992 shall ‘not'be credited’ = - " .
-for fiscal year 2006 as surplus under section 1316(d) of such Act ~"""". »
or as part of any assessment to be collected for fiscal year 2006.
under section 1316(a) of such Act: Provided further, That not to
exceed the amount provided herein shall be available-from - the: :
general fund of the Treasury to the extent necessary to incur -,
obligations and make expenditures pending the receipt of collections- ... - -
to the Fund: Provided further, That the general fund amount shall .
be reduced as collections are received during the fiscal year so _
as to result in a final appropriation from the general fund estimated * - - _
at not more than $0.’ : T o :

TITLE VI—GENERAL PROVISIONS AND TECHNICAL sy
CORRECTIONS ) - T

i

AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS

SEC. 6001. No part of any appropriation containéd in this . - : , R
Act shall remain available for obligation beyond the current fiscal
year unless expressly so provided herein. : o

REFERENCES TO EMERGENCY REQUIREMENTS

SEC. 6002. Any reference in this Act to section 402 of the,
conference report to accompany S. Con. Res. 85 (108th Congress) 3
shall be treated as a reference to the emexﬁenéy legislation section '
of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), if H. Con. Res. 95 (109th ST
Congress) is adopted prior te the enactment of this Act. - o =

RURAL BUSINESS-COOPERATIVE SERVICE :

SEc. 6003. None of the funds made available by this or, any .
other Act may be used to deny the:provision of assistance under L
section 310B(a}(1) of the Consolidated Farm and Rural Development
Act (7 U.8.C. 1932(a)1)) solely due to the failure of the Secretary.
of Labor to respond to a request to certify assistance within the
time period specified in section 310B(d}(4) of that Act. - o

* o * * * * *

v o

. .
1k




. "119 STAT. 288 * PUBLIC LAW 109-13—MAY 11, 2005

118 Btat. 3072,

Coe

Economy Act are explicitly identified in each Congressional-appro-
Fnatmns justification in support of the President’s budget prmnded

- for each agency and component of the Department.

OFFICE OF THE CHIEF INFORMATION OFFICER

SeC. 6026. Of the funds provided under the headin, g “Office
of the Chief Information Officer” in Public Law 108-334, $5,000,000
shall not be obligated for salaries and expenses until an expendlture

_glan is submitted to the Committees o6n Appropriations of- the

enate and the House of Representatives for any information tech-
nolo%iﬁroject that: (1) is funded by the “Office of the Chief Informa-
tion cer”; or (2) is funded by multiple components of the Depart-
ment of Homeland Security through reimbursable agreements: Pro-
vided, That such expenditure plan shall include each specific project
ftmded key milestones, all funding sources for each project, details

.of annual ‘and hfecycle costs, and projected cost’savings or cost
. avoidance to be achieved by project: Provided further, That the

expenditure plan shall include a complete list of all legacy systems

rational as of March 1, 2003, thé current operatlonal status

Fgach gystem, and the plans for continued operation or termmatlon
of each system.

RESC]SSION OF FUNDS
~ SEC. 6027 Of the funds appropnated by Public Law 108-

334 (118 Stat. 1298, 1300, 1302), the following are rescinded:

$500,000 under the headmg “Office of the Secretary and Executive
Management”; $3,300,000 under the heading “Office of the, Under
Secretary for Management” $76,000,000 under the headmg “Cus-
toms and Border Protection, Salaries and Expenses”; and
$85,200,000 under the heading “Immlgratlon and Customs Enforce-
ment, Salaries and Expenses”.

SEc. 6028, Of the unobligated balances avallable in the “Deparb—
ment of Homeland Secunty Workmg Capital Fund" $20 000,000
are rescinded. . C ot

REPROGRAMMING AND TRANSFER OF FUNDS

SEC. 6029. Any funds made’ available to the Department of
Homeland Security by this Act shall be subJect to the terms and
conditions of Title V of Public Law 108-334.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT, TECHNICAL CORRECTION

SEC. 6030. Section 144 of division E of Public Law 108447
is amended in ‘T}Jaragraph (bX2) by striking “Sep’oember 24 - 2004"
and inserting “November 12, 2004”. . .

FOREST SERVICE TRANSFER

Sec. 6031. Funds in the amount of.$1,500,000, prowded in
Public Law 108-447 for the “Forest Service, Cap1ta1 Im rovement
and Maintenance” account, are hereby transferred to the “Forest
Service, State and Private Forestry’ account. .

WEST YELLOWSTONE VISITOR INFORMATION CENTER ]

—> SEC. 6032. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the

National Park Service is authorized to expend appropriated funds




PUBLIC LAW 109-13—MAY 11, 2005 . 119 .STAT. 289

~ for the construction, operations and maintenance of an expansion

- to the West Yellowstone Vigitor Information Center to be con-
structed for visitors to, and administration of, Yellowstone National
Park.

PESTICIDES TOLERANCE FEES

SEC 6033 . None of the funds in thls or any other Appropnat:nons

Act may be used by the Environmental Protection Agency or. any

.. other Federal agency to develop, promulgate, or publish a pesticides
tolerance fee’ emakmg. .

GULF ISLANDS NATIONAL SEASHORE |

;= SEC. 6034 (a) The Secretary of the Interior shall a]low the Mississippi.
"State of. Mississippi, its lessees, contractors, and permittees, to Minerals.
. conduct, under reasonable regulation not inconsistent with extrac-

tion of the oil and gas miner:; 5 reserved by the State of Mississippi
. in the deed referenced in subsectmn (b):

(1) exploration, development and production operations on

sités outside the boundaries of Gulf Islands National Seashare
that use directional drilling techniques which result in the
drill hole crossing inte the Gulf Islands National Seashore
_ and passing under any land or water the surface of which
=1 ig.owned by the United States, including berm.lnatmg in. bottom
o ’hole locations thereunder; and
' (2) seismic and seismic-related exploration act1v1t1es mslde
‘the boundanes of Gulf Islands National Seashore to. 1dent1fy

a k"

x!,:. P

Y R e

-Gulf Islands National Seashore under the surface estate con-
=" veyed by -the State of Mississippi, all of which oil and”gas
minerals the State of Mississippi reserved the right to extract.
“*'(b)-The provisions of subsection (a) shall not take effect until Contracts.
C the State of Mississippi enters into-an agreement with the Secretary

providing that any actions by the United States in relation to

the provisions in the section shall not trigger any reverter of any

estate conveyed by the State of Mississippi to the United States
-, ,within the Gulf Islands National Seashore in Chapter 482 of the
" General, Laws of, the State of Mzsmsmppl 1971, and the qmtclalm

deed of June 15, 1972. ] .

SURFACE MINING CONTROL AND RECLAMATION ACT

. SEc. 6035.' Section 402(b) of the Surface Mining Control and
"Reclamation ‘Act of 1977 (30 U.8.C. 1232(b)) is amended by stnkmg
“June 30, 2005,” and inserting “September 30, 2005,", -

RESIDENT AND NONRESIDENT IIWTNG AND FISHING REGULATIONS

" " “BEc. 6036. STATE REGULATION OF RESIDENT AND NONRESIDENT Reaffirmation of
. HUNTING AND" FISHING. (a) SHORT TITLE.—This section may be State Regulation
citéd as the “Reaffirmation of State Regulation of Resident and {f Residantand

Nonresident Hunting and Fishing Act of 2005”. ° Huating and
(b} DECLARATION OF, PoLICY AND CONSTRUCTION OF CONGRES- %m
SIONAL SILENCE.— of 2003.

. (1) IN GENERAL~-It is the gohcy of Congress that it~is
- ¢ in the public interest for each te to continue -to regulate

* * * * * *




PUBLIC LAW 109-13—MAY 11, 2005 119 STAT. 323

“(ii) MaxiMuM.—The total number of visas made avail-
able under paragraph (1) from unused visas from the fiscal
years 2001 through 2004 may not exceed 50,000.”,

Approved May 11, 2005.

. LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 1268:

HOUSE REPORTS: Nos. 109-1)6 {Comm. on Appropnat:ons) and 109—72 (Comm. of
erence
SENATE REPORTS: No, 109-52 (Comm. on Appmpnatlons)
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol 151 (2005):
- - Mar. 185, 16, considered and passed House.
11—15 18-21, considered and passed Senate, amended.
5 Hou.se agreed to conference report
(, Senate to conference repe
'WEEKLY COMPILATI OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS Vol. 41 (2005):
: May 11, Presidential statement. - .

0O




--119 STAT. 324 PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005

May 31, 2005

[H.R. 2566]

Surface
Transportation
Extension Act of
2005.

23 USC 101 note.

23 USC 104 note.

Public Law 109-14
109th Congress
An Act

To provide an extension of highway, highway safety, motor carrier safety, transit,
and other programs funded out of the Highway Trust Fund pending enactment
of a law reauthorizing the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Surface Transportation Extension
Act of 2005”.

SEC. 2. ADVANCES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2(a)1) of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2004, Part V (23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat.
1144) is amended by striking “as amended by this section” and
inserting “as amended by this Act and the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005”.

(b) PROGRAMMATIC DISTRIBUTIONS.—

(1) ADMINISTRATION OF FUNDS.—Section 2(b}3) of such Act
(118 Stat. 1145) is amended by striking “the amendment made
under subsection (d)” and inserting “section 110L(1) of the
Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century”.

(2) SPECIAL RULES FOR MINIMUM GUARANTEE.—Section
2(b)X4) of such Act is amended by striking “$1,866,666,667"
and inserting “$2,100,000,000".

(3) EXTENSION OF OFF-SYSTEM BRIDGE SETASIDE.—Section
144(gX3) of title 23, United States Code, is amended by striking
“May 31” inserting “June 30".

(¢)  AUTHORIZATION OF CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Section
1101(1X1) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(118 Stat. 1145) is amended by striking “$22,685,936,000 for the
geriod of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserfing
3%2%33;’;678,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through June

{d) LIiMITATION ON OBLIGATIONS.—Section 2(e) of- the Surface
Transportation Extension ‘Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1146)
is amended to read as follows: L - .

“(e) LIMITATION ON OBLIGATIONS.— : S

“(1) DISTRIBUTION OF OBLIGATION AUTHORITY.—Subject to
paragraph (2), for the period of October 1, 2004, through June
30, 2005, the Secretary shall distribute the obligation limitation
made available for Federal-aid highways and. highway safety
construction ;iroFrams under the heading ‘FEDERAL-AID HIGH-
wAYS’ in title I of division H of the Consolidated Appropriations

Act, 2005 (23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat. 3204), in accordance




PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005 119 STAT. 325

.with section 110 of such title (23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat.
3209); except that the amount of obligation limitation to be
distributed for such period for each program,-project, and
activity specified in sections 110(3)(1) 110(a)2), 110(a)(4), and
110(a 5) of such title shall equal the greater of— -

“(A) the funding authorized for such program, project,
or activity. in, this Act and the Surface ansportatmn
Extenslon Act of 2005 (including any amendments made

.- by this Act and such Act); or
Lo “(B) %2 of .the funding prov1ded for ‘or limitation set
on such program, project, or activity in title I of division

H of the 8 nsolidated Appropriations Act, 2005.

%2) LIMITATION ON TOTAL AMOUNT OF AUTHORITY DISTRIB-
UTED.—The total amount of obligation limitation distributed
under paragr 5ph (1) for the period of October 1, 2604, through
June 30, 2005, shall not exceed $26,025,000, 000 except that

_this hmltatxon shall not apply to $479 250 000 in obligations
for minimum guarantee for such period. -

“(3) TIME PERIOD FOR OBLIGATIONS OF FUNDS. —Aﬂ;er June
30, 2005, no'funds shall be obligated for any Federal-aid high-

. way t‘grogram l1;»1‘(}*_]%1; until the date of enactment of a law
" reauthorizing the Federal-aid highway program. -
“(4) TREATMENT OF OBLIGATIONS.—Any obhgatmn of obliga-  Applicability.
+ »  tion authority distributed under this subsection shall be consid-
ered to be an obligation for Federal-md highways and highway
safety construction p (Fra.ms for fiscal year 2005 for the pur-
ses of the matter under the heading ‘FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAYS'
mn title I of division H of the Consolidated Appropriations
Act, 2005 (23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat. 3204).”.

SEC. 3. ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.

. Section 4(a) of the Surface Transportation Extension Act of
2004 (118 Stat. 1147) is amended by st.nkmg “$234,682,667" and
-inserting “$264,018,000”. : ]

-. SEC.'4. OTHER FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAY PROGRAMS. .
(a) AUTHORIZATION OF Appnopmnons UNDER TrrLE 1 oF TEA~

(1) FEDERAL LANDS HIGHWAYS.—
{A) INDIAN RESERVATION ROADS.—Section 1101(a)(8)(A)
of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(112 Stat. 112 118 Stat. 1147) is amended—
(i) in the first sentence by striking “$183,333,333
for the peried of October 1, 2004, through May 31,
2005” and inserting “$206, 250 000 for the period of
October 1, 2004, through June 30 2005”; and
(ii) in the second sentence by stnkmg “$8,666,667”
and inserting “$9,750,600".
_ (B) PUBLIC LANDS HIGHWAYS. —-—Sectmn 1101(aX8XB) of
such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148) is amended by
sl;ri.k.inﬁ “$164,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
May 31, 2005” and inserting “$184,500,000 for
the nod of October 1, 2004, through June. 30 2005,
e . C) PARK ROADS AND PARKWAYS.—Section 1101(a)(8)(C)
ek . of such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat, 1148) is. amended
: . tl¥ro triking “$110,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
ugh May 31, 2005” and inserting “$123,750, 000 for
the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30 2005”.




119 STAT.-326

* PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005

(D) REFUGE ROADS.—Section 1101(a)8)(D) of such Act
(112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148) is amended by striking
"«$13,333,333 for the period: of October 1, 2004, through
May 31, 2005” ‘and inserting “$15,000,000 for the period
of Octeber 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”.
(2) NATIONAL CORRIDOR PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT AND

* COORDINATED BORDER INFRASTRUCTURE PROGRAMS.—Section

1101(aX9) of such Act’ (112 Stat. 112; -118 Stat. 1148) is
amended by striking “$93,333,333 for the period of October
1, 2004, through May 31, 20057 and 'inserting “$105,000,000
for the period of October 1, 2004, thiough June 30, 2005”.
~ (3) 'CONSTRUCTION OF FERRY BOATS AND FERRY TERMINAL
FACILITIES.—,, S ) U ‘
(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 1101(a)(10) of such Act (112
Stat. 113;. 118 Stat. 1148) -is .amended by strikin
“$95 333,333 for the period of October 1, 2004, throug
May 31, 2005” and inserting “$28,500,000 for the: period
- - of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”7 =~
. (B) SET ASIDE FOR ALASKA, NEW JERSEY, AND WASH-
INGTON.—Section ‘5(aX3)B) of the Surface Transportation
Extension, Act of 2004, Part V. (118 Stat. 1148) is
. amended— . ' PR
' (i) in clause (i} by striking “$6,666,667" and
inserting “$7,500,0007; - .

| ;.' -7 (i) in clause (i) by striking “$3,333,333" and

' ingerting “$3,750,000";and . - . .
.t . (iiiY in- clause (iii) by. striking “$3,333,333" and
inserting “$3,750,000. ST L
(4) NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS PROGRAM.—Section
1101(aX11) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Cen-

- tury (112 Stat. '113; 118 Stat.°1148) is amended by«st:n'.king

“2001,” and all that follows through “May 31, 2005” -an
inserting “2001, $25,500,000 for fiscal year 2002, $26,500,000
for each of fiscal years 2003 ‘and- 2004, and $19,875,000 for

. the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”. -

(5) VALUE PRICING PILOT PROGRAM.—Section 1101(a){12)
of such Act (112 Stat..113; 118 Stat. 1148) is amended b
striking “$7,333,333 for the period of Octaber 1, 2004, throug

. May 381, 2005” and inserting “$8,250,000 for the period of

October 1, 2004, through June 30, 20057, ,
(6) HIGHWAY USE . TAX EVASION PROJECTS.—Section

. 1101(aX14) of -such: Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148) is

amended by striking “$3,333,333 for the period of October 1,
2004, through May 31, 2005” and- inserting “$3,750,000 for

. "the period of October 1; 2004, through June 30, 2005”.

{7) COMMCONWEALTH OF PUERTQ RICO HIGHWAY PROGRAM.—

. Section 1101(a)X15XA) of such Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat.

1149) is amended by striking “$73,333,333 for the period of
October 1, 2004, through. May 31, 2005” and inserting

‘:;%822;300,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through June
. 30,2005%. . ¢ s

(8) SAFETY GRANTS.—Section 1212G)X1)D) of such Act (23
U.S.C. 402 note; 112 Stat. 196; 112 Stat..840; 118 Stat. 1149)
is amended by striking “$333,333 for the period of October
1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting “$375,000 for
the period of Octobér 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”.




PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005 119 STAT. 327

(9) TRANSPORTATION AND COMMUNITY AND SYSTEM
PRESERVATION, PILOT PROGRAM.—Section 1221(eX1) of such Act
(23 U.S.C. 101 note; 112 Stat. 223; 118 Stat. 1149) is amended
. by striking “$16,666,667 for the period of Octaber 1, 2004,
t.hrough May 31, 2005” and inserting “$18,750,000 for the penod
- of October 1 2004, through June 30, 2005”.

. (10) TRANSPORTATION INFRASTRUCTURE FINANCE AND
INNOVATION.—Section, 188 .of title 23, United. States Code, is

. amended—

foll (a) by striking subsectlon @)(L(G) and msertmg the

ollowing

"(G) '$97,500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
through June 30, 2005.”

(B} in subsection. (a){2) by stnkmg “$1,333,333 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and
inserting “$1,500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004
through June 30 2005” and

(C) in the item relating to ﬁscal year 2005 in the
table contained in subsection (c) by striking

, “$1,733,333,333” and inserting “$1,950,000,000”.

, (11) NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS' CLEARINGHOUSE.—Section
1215(bX3) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 2lst Century
(112 Stat. 210; 118 Stat. 1149) is amended— -

a (A) by striking “$1, 000,000” and inserting '“$1,125,0007;
an

(B) by striking “May 31” and inserting “June 30”.

(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS UNDER TITLE V:oF

TEA-21.—

(1) SURFACE TRANSPORTATION = RESEARCH.—Section
5001(a)1) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149) is amended by striking
. “$68,666,667 for the period of October 1, 2004, through May
31, 2005” and inserting “$77,250,000 for the penod of October
1, 2004 through June 30, 2005"

S 2 TECHNOLOGY  DEPLOYMENT  PROGRAM.—Section

5001(3)(2) of such Act (112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149) is
amended by striking “$33,333,333 for the period of October
"1, 2004, through May 31, 2005" and inserting “$37,500,000
for. the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”.

3) 'Ef.qmme AND EDUCATION.—Section. 5001(a)(3) of such
"Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150} is amended by s
“$13 333,333 for the period of October 1, 2004, through May
‘31, 2005” and inserting “$15,000,000 -for the penod of October
1, 2004 through June 30 2005".

{4) BUREAU OF TRANSPORTATION STATISTICS. —Section
5001(a)}4) of such Act {112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150) is
amended by .striking “$20,666,667 for the period of October
1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting “$23,250,000
for the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”.

(5) ITS STANDARDS, RESEARCH, OPERATIONAL TESTS, AND
DEVELOPMENT.—Section 5001(a}5) of such Act (112 Stat. 420,
118 Stat. 1150) is amended by striking “$73,333,333 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting
;%822 053{(,)”000 for the penod of October 1, 2004, through June

(6) ITs DEPLOYMENT.—Section 5001(a}6) of such Act (112
Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150} is amended by striking “$81,333,333




74119 STAT. 328 . PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005

' for the period of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005”

" and inserting “$91,500,000 for the- penod of October 1 2004,

through June 30, 2005”. :

(7) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH. —Sectmn
5001{aX7) of such Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150) is
amended by striking “$17,666,667 for the period of October
1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting “$19,875,000
for the penod of October ‘1, 2004; through June 30, 2005,

. (c) METROPOLITAN PLANNING ~—Section 5(c)1) of the Surface

Transportatmn Extension "Act -of 2004, Part V-(118 Stat. 1150)

is amended by striking “$145,000,000 for the period of October

© 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and- inserting “$163,125,000 for

‘ the penod of October 1, 2004 through June 30, 2005,

- (d) TERRITORIES —Section 1101(dX1) of - the Transportation
Equity Act for the 21st Century (112 Stat. 111;'118 Stat. 1150)
is amended by striking “$24,266 1667 for the penod of October 1,

. 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting “$27,300,000 for the
- period of October 1; 2004 through June 30, 2005”.

‘ (e) ALASKA HIGHWAY.—Section 1101(e)(1) of such Act (118 Stat.

1150) is amended by striking “$12,533,333 for the period of October

"1, 2004, through May 31, 2005 and inserting “$14,100,000 for

the penod of 0ctober 1 2004 through June 30, 2005”.

(f) OPERATION LIFESAVER.—Section 1101(f)(1) of such ‘Act (118
Stat. 1151) is amended by striking “$333,333 for the period of
October 1,.2004, through May 31,-2005” and inserting “$375,000
for the permd of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”.

(g} BRIDGE DISCRETIONARY. —Section 1101(g)(1) of such Act (118
Stat, 115 1) is amended—

d(l) by striking “$66, 666 667” and msertmg "$75 000,000™;
an

(2) by stnkmg “May. 31" and inserting “June 30" :

(h) INTERSTATE MAINTENANCE. —Sectmn 1101¢h)(1) of such Act
(118 Stat. 1151} is amended— .

i (1) by: stn.king “$66 666 667” and insérting “$75 000 000™;
an
. (@) by stnkmg “May 31” and msertmg “June 30”. ,

“ (i) RECREATIONAL TRAILS Anmmxsmm CosTs —Section
1101(1)(1) of such Act (118 Stat. 1151) is amended by striking
“$500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005
and inserting “$562,500 for the penod of October 1, 2004, thmugh
June 30, 2005”.

G) RA.I:LWAY—HIGHWAY CROSSING HAZARD ELIM]NATION N HicH
SPEED RAIL CORRIDORS. —Sectmn 1101(])(1) of such Act (118 Stat.
1151) is amended—

(1) by striking “$3,5600,000” and msemng “$3 937,5007

(2) by striking “$166,667" and inserting “$187,500" and
Ju (3233;{ striking “May 31”7 each place it appears and msertmg
“dJune
- (k) NONDISCRIMINATION. —Sectmn 1101(k) of such Act (118 Stat.

1151) is amended— -

o (1) in paragraph (1) by striking “$6,666,667 for the period
‘of October 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting
“$7,500,000 for the penod of Octaber 1, 2004, through June
30, 2006”; and

" (2) in paragraph (2) by striking “$6,666,667 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and inserting

10




. PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005 119 STAT. 329

. “$7,500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, thmugh June

-30, 2005”

T ADMINISTRATION or FuNDs.—Section 5(1) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part -V (118 Stat. 1151).
is amended—

o (1) by inserting “and section 4 of the Surface Transportatmn
- =% - Extension Act of 2005” after “this section”.the first place it
appears; and

(2) by inserting “or the amendment made by section 4(aX1)

+  of such Act” before the period at the end.
- (m) REDUCTION -OF ALLOCATED PROGRAMS.—Section 5(m) of
L such Act (118 Stat. 1151) is amended—

{1) by inserting “and section 4 of the Surface 'I‘ransportatmn

_Extension Act of 2005 after “but for this section”;

{2} by striking “both™;, .
(3) by st.nkmg “and by this section” and msertmg , by

“this’ sectlon, and by section 4 of such Act” and .

(4) inserting “and by section 4 ‘of such Act” before

; the at the end.

(n) lgBOGRAM CATEGORY RECONCILIATION.—Section 5(n) of such
-Act. (118, Stat. 1151) is amended by inserting “and section 4 of
the Surface Transportatmn Extension Act of 2005” aﬂ;er “this sec-

. tion”. - -

. SEC,S. EXTENSION OF HIGHWAY BAFETY PROGRAMS.

‘ _(a) CHAPTER 1 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.— =~
(1) SEAT BELT SAFETY INCENTIVE GRANTS. ——Sectwn 157(gX1)
~of title- 23, United- States Code, is amended by striking

“$74,666,667 for the period of October 1, 2004, through May

31, 2005” and inserting “$84,000,000 for the penod of October

1, 2004, through June 30, 2005

(2) PREVENTION OF INTOXICATED DRIVER INCENTIVE
~GRANTS.—Section 163(eX1) of such title is"amended by striking
" “$73,333,333 for the period of October 1; 2004, .through May

31, 2005” and inserting “$82,500,000 for the penod of Oct.ober

1, 2004 through June 30, 2005".

.(b) CHAPTER 4 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.—Section 2009(a)(1)
of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century (112 Stat.

. 337; 118 Stat..1152) is amended by striking “$110,000,000 for
the penod of October 1, 2004, through May 31, 2005” and msertmg
;%1%%07559 ,000 for the penod of October 1, 2004, ‘through June

{c) HIGHWAY SAFETY RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT.—Section
2009(aX2) of such Act (112 Stat. 337; 118 Stat. 1152) is amended
by striking “1998 through” and all that follows through “May 31,
2005” ingerting “1998 through 2004 and $54,000,000 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”,

(d) OCCUPANT PROTECTION .- INCENTIVE GRANTS.—Section
,2009(&)(3) of such Act (112 Stat. 337; 118 Stat. 1152) is amended

striking “$13,333,333 for the period of October 1, 2004, through
. Nfay 31, 2005” and inserting “$15,000,000 for the penod of October
1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”,

(e) ' ALCOHOL-IMPAIRED DRIVING COUNTERMEASURES INCENTIVE
GRrANTS.—Section 2009(aX4) of such Act (112 Stat. 337; 118 Stat.
1153) is amended by striking “$26,666,667 for the. Benod of October
1, 2004, through May. 31, 2005™ and inserting “$30,000,000 for
the penod of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”. .

BT




119 STAT. 330 - PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005

(f) NATIONAL DRIVER REGISTER.—Section 2009(a)(6) of such Act
(112 Stat. 338; 118 Stat. 1153) is amended by striking “$2,400,000
for the penod of October 1, 2004, ugh May 31 '2005” and
inserting “$2,700,000 for the period of October 2004 through
June 30, 2005".

SEC. 6. FEDERAL MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY ADM]NISTRATION PRO-
GRAM.

* (a) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section 7(a)(1) of the Surface
’I‘ransportation Extension Act of 2004, Part' V (118 Stat. 1153)
is amended by striking “$160,552,536 for the ‘period of October
1, 2004, throuﬁ May 31, 2005 and inserting “$192,631,044 for
the perlod Qctober 1, 2004 through June 30, 2005”. - -

(b) MoTOR ‘CARRIER SAFETY ASSISTANCE PROGRAM —Section
31104(a)8) of title 49 Umted States Code, is amended to read
as follows:

. “(8) Not more than $126, 402, 740 for the penod of Qctober
* 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005.”
G (c) INFORMATION SYS’I‘EMS AND COMMERCIAL DRIVER'S LICENSE
"GRANTS.—
(1) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATION. —Sectlon 31107(a)(6)
of such title is amended to read as follows:
“(5) $14,958,904 for the peried of October 1, 2004 through

June 30, 2005.”. 1

(2) EMERGENCY CDL GRANTS —Section 7(c)(2) of the Siurface

’l‘ransportatxon Extension Act of 2004, Part v (118 Stat. 1153)

is amended—
(A) by striking “May _ 31” and msertmg “June 30,%;

and
: (B) by striking “$665,753” and inkerting “$747 945,
(d) CrasH CAUSATION STUDY. —Sectmn (G of such Act (118
Stat. 1154) is amended—
: (1) by striking “$665, 753" and msertmg “$747 945”; and
(2) by stnkmg “May 31” and inserting “J une. 307,

SEC. 7. EXTENSION OF FEDERAL TRANSIT PBOGRAMS

. - {a) ALLOCATING AMOUNTS —Sectmn 5309(m) of title 49 United
States Code, is amended—
(1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A) of paragraph
(1 b(y striking “May 31, 2005” and inserting’ “June 30 20057,
 (2)in glaragraph (2)B)Gi—
in the headmg by . striking “MAY 3, 2005 and
inserting “JUNE 30, 2008";
(B) y stnkmg “$6, 933 333” and msertmg “$7,800,0007;

and
(C) by stnkmg “May 31 2005” and msertlng “June
30, 2005™; - oo
(3)in g:aragraph( i
i (A) by striking “$2 0(}0 000 and mserbmg “$2 250 000™;
(B) by “striking “May 31, -2005” and mserhn’g “June
80, 2005”; and . )
.(4) in Karagraph 3xC— o .
stnkmg “$33 333,333”'“ and insei'ting
' “$37 500, 000"
- (B) by stnkmg “May 31 2005” and msertmg “June
30, 2005”. -

12




© PUBLIC.LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005 . 119 STAT. 331

- (b) FORMULA GRANTS AUTHORIZATIONS.—Section. 5338(a) of title
49, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in the headmg to paragraph (2) by stnkmg “MAY 31,
" 2005” and inserting “JONE 30, 20057; -
(2) in paragraph (2XAXvii)—
(A) striking  “$2,201,760, 000” and inserting
“$2,545,785,000”; and
{B) by stn]nng “May 31, 2005” and msertmg “June
30, 2005%;
- (@) in paragraph (2XB)vii) by stnkmg “May 31 2005"
and inserting “June 30, 2005”; and
. (4) in paragraph {2XC) by stnkmg “May 31, 2005” and
" inserting “June 30, 2005".
(c) FORMULA GRANT FUNDS. ——Sectmn 8(d) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act.of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1155}
_ is amended—
' {1) in the headmg by striking “MAY 31, 2005” and inserting
“JUNE 30, 2005”; .
~{2} in'the matter precedmg paragraph (1) by striking “May
- . 31,2005" and inserting “June 30, 2005";
277 (3) in paragraph'(1) by stnkmg “$3,233,300" and inserting
“$3,637,462";
(4) in paragraph (2) by stnkmg “$33 333 333” and msertmg
* “$37,500,0007; - -
(5) in paragraph (3) by stnkmg “$65 064 001" and inserting
“+$73,197,001™;
© . (6) in paragraph ) by striking “$172,690,702” and
* inserting “$194,277,040™;
. (7) in paragraph (5) by striking “$4,633,333" and mserl:mg
“$5,212,5007; and
{8) in paragraph (6) by striking “$2,473, 245 331" and
inserting “$2,782,400,997".
(d) CAPITAL PrOGRAM AUTHORIZATIONS.—Section 5338(b)2) of
s title 49, Umted States Code, is amended—
(1) in the headmg by stnlung “MAY 31, 2005” and inserting
*“JUNE 30, 20057;
(2) in subparagraph (A)(vu)— o
. (A) 'by - striking “$1, 740 ,960,000” - and inserting
“$2,012, 985 000” and
© ..(B) by stnkmg “May 31, 2005” and msertmg “June
30 20057; and
@) in suhparagraph (BXvii)- by stnkmg “May 31, 2005”
and inserting “June 30, 2005".
(e} PLANNING AUTHORIZATIONS * AND . ALLOCATIONS.—Section
- 5338(cX2) of title 49, United States Code, is a.mended—
(1) in the headmg by stnkmg “MAY 31, 2005 and inserting
"“JUNE 30, 2005”; -
(2) in subparagraph (A)( i}—
(A) by striking “$41 813, 334" ,and inserting
“348(%?%668” and .
striking . “May 31 20057 and inserting “June
30, 2005”; and £
(3) in subparagraph (B)vii) by stnkmg “May 31 2005”
and inserting “June 30, 2005”.
- " (f) RESEARCH Aumoamnons —Section 5338(d)(2) of tlﬂe 49,
United States Code, is amended— , _

13




- 119'STAT. 332 .~ PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31;°2005

(1) in the headmg by striking "MAY 31, 2005”7 and msert.mg
“JUNE 30, 2005” e Lo
(2)in subparagraph (A)vii )
(A) by striking “$28 266 667” .and inserting
“$32,683,333"; and
(B) by stnk:mg “May 31, 2005" and msertmg “June
30, 2005™;
(3) in subparagraph (B)(vu) by stnkmg “May 31, 2005”
and inserting “June 30, 2005™; an
© {4) in aubparagraph (&) by stnkmg “May 31, 2005” and

inserting “June 30, 2005”.

(g) ALLOCATION OF RESEARCH FUNDS. —Sectwn 8(h) of the Sur-
face Transportat:mn Extensmn Act of 2004 Part V (118 Stat. 1156)
is amended— ,

(1) in the heading by striking "MAY 31, 2005” and. msertmg

“JUNE 30, 2005”;

(2) in the matter preceding paragraph (1) by stnkmg “May

81, 2005” and inserting “June 30, 20057;

. (@ in paragraph (1) by stnkmg “$3 500,000” and msartmg

“$3,937,500”; -

{4) in paragraph (2) by stnkmg “$5 500, 000” and msertmg

“$6,187,500”; and

.(5)in paragraph (3)—
o (A) by striking “$2 666 667” and msertmg “$3 000,0007;
an
(B) by striking “5666 667” and msertmg “$750,000".
(h) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH AUTHORIZATIONS.—
Sectlon 5338(e}(2) of title 49, United States. Code,-is amended—
‘ (1) in the heading hy striking “MAY 31, 2005 and msertmg
JUNE 30, 2005”;
{2)in subparagra h (A)— .
{A) by stnkmg “$3, 200 000” and msertmg “$3 700,000”;

and
30, ((l)?a)sby striking “May 31, 2005" and msertmg “June
2 0 »
(8) in subparagraph (B) by stnkmg “May 31 2005" and
inserting “June 30, 20057, and
{4) in. subparagraphs (C)(i) .and (C)ii) by stnkmg “May
31, 2005” and inserting “June 30, 2005”. . ~
FUN%) ALLOCATION COF.. UNIVERSITY IRANSPORTATION RESEARCH
S —
: (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 8(j) of the Su.rface Transportatmn
Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1157) is amended—
(A) in.the matter preceding subparagraph (A) of para-
g!daglé 0(51”) by striking “May 31, 2005” and inserting “June
(B) in paragraph (1XA) by stnkmg “$1,333,333” and
inserting “$1,500,0007;
" (Q)in paragraph (1XB) by stnkmg "$1 333,333” and
inserting “$1,500,0007; and
' (D) in paragraph (2) by: stnkmg “May 31, 2005” and
inserting “June 30, 2005” .
(2} - CONFORMING - AMENDMENT. -~ Section- 3015(d)(2) of the
Transportatlon Equity Act for the 21st Century (112 Stat, 857;
43USC6H338 118 Stat. 1157) is amended by stnkmg “May 31 2005 and
note. inserting “June 30, 2005”. -

14




PUBLIC.LAW109-14---MAY 31, 2005 _ ‘119 STAT. 333

j} ADMINISTRATION AUTHORIZATIONS. —Sectaon 5338(1)(2) of title

49 nited States Code, is amended— -
(1) in the headmg by stnkmg "MAY 8] 2005 and msertmg }

30 2005 i '-‘! .'. 4
(2) in subparagraph (AXvii)—
&) by, striking'."."$41,600,000" and inserti.ng

- “$48,100, 000” and
. (B) by strllqng “May 31 2005” and msertmg “June

30, 2005” and .
(3) in subparagraph (B)(vu) by stnkmg “May 31 \2005"
and inserting “June 30,-2005” . .

(k) JoB ACCESS AND' "REVERSE COMMUTE PROGRAM _ Section
© 3087(1) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century (49
- U.S.C. 5309 note; 112. Stat. 391; 118 Stat 1157) is; amended—-—
(1) in K)aragraph (DAY vii)—
triking “$80 000 000" a.nd msertmg
“$92 500, 000” vand. ™ T
: _ (B) by stnkmg “May 31 2005” and msertmg “June
o 30, 20057; -t
(2) in paragraph (1)(B)(vu) hy stnkmg "May 31 2005”
and inserting “June 30, 2005”; and = .
* * {(3) in paragraph® (2) by st.nkmg “May 31, 2005 ‘not more
than $6,666,667" and msertmg “June 30 2005 - not’ more. than
-7 $7,500,000”. - ¢
L RURAL TRANSPORTATION ACCESSIB[LITY INCENTIVE PRO-
GRAM.~Section 3038(g) of the Transportation Equity Act for the
21st Century (49 U.S, C 5310, note 112 Stat 393 118 Stat. 1158)
- ma;pended—— ‘- S
S (1) by st:nklng paragraph (1)(G) and inserting after para-
T graph(l)(F) the following: - -
“G) "$3,937,500“for the penod of October 1, 2004,
o through June 30, 2005 ;and | _
; * (2)in paragraph’ (2)—
L (A) by stnkmg “81, 133 333” and mserhng “$1 275,000,

L) ) and
s ..,.', 30, 2([1130)5,1,:)! stnkmg “May 81, 2005” and inserting “June
. (m) URBANIZED AR.EA FORMULA GRANTS.—Section - 5307(b)(2)
of tltle 49 United States Code, is amended—
R (1) in the heading by striking “MAY 31, 2005 and inserting
JUNE 30, 20057; and .
.2 in subparagraph (A) by striking “May 31, 2005” and
msert.mg “June 30, 2005™.
.(n) OBLIGATION CEILING.—Section 3040(7) of the Transportation
Equlty Act for the 2lst Century (112 Stat. 394; 118 Stat 1158)
- is amended— or
(1) by stnkmg 45, 172 000,000" . and inserting
“$5 818,500,000”; and . .
300 5(”2) by stnk.mg “May 31, 2005” and inserting “June 30,
(o) FUEL CELL Bus AND Bus FACILITIES PROGRAM.—Section
3015(b)  of the Transportatlon Equity Act for the 2ist Century
(112 Stat 361; 118 Stat. 1158) is amended—
S (1) by striking “May 31, 2005” and msertmg “June 30,
' 2005” and .
(2) by striking “$3 233 333" and inserting “$3,637,500”.

15




119 STAT. 334  'PUBLIC LAW!109-14—MAY 31, 2005

23 USC 322 note.

23 USC 101 note.

(p) ADVANCED TECHNOLOGY PILOT PROJECT.—Section 3015(cX2)
of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century (49 U.S.C.
" 322 note; 112 Stat 361; 118 tat. 1158) is amended— -
(1) by stnkmg “May 31 2005” and msertmg “June 30,
2005”; and
S (D) by striking “$3,333, 333" and msertmg “$3,750,000”,
(q) PROJECTS FOR NEW FIXED GUIDEWAY. SYSTEMS AND EXTEN-

. SIONS TO 'EXISTING SYsTEMS.—Subsections (a), (b), and (cX1) of

section 3030 of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century

"(112.Stat. 373; 118, Stat. 1158) are .amended by striking “May
31, 2005” and msert.mg “June 30, 2005”....

-(r) NEw JERSEY URBAN CORE ‘PROJECT. -—Subp o%graphs (A),
(B) and’ (C)} of section 3031(a}3) of the Interm
Transportation Efficiency Act of 1991°(105 Stat. 2122; 118. Stat
1158) are amended by stnkmg “May 31, 2005” and msertmg “June
30, 2005™.

(8) TREATMENT OF FUNDS —Amounts made available under the
amendments made by this :section shall be treated for purposes
of section 1101¢(b) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st
Century (23 U.S8.C. 101 note) as amounts made available for pro-
grams under title IIf of such Act. =. - v .

(t) LOCAL SHARE.—Section 3011(a) of: the ’I‘ransportatmn Equity

- Act for the 21st.Century (49 U.S.C. 5307 note; 118 Stat. 1158)

is amended by stnkmg “May 31 2005” and 1nserhng “June 30,

-2005", o e
'SEC. s.spommsnmcmnmmcsmr e

(a) FUNDING FOR NATIONAL OU'I'REACH AND COMMUNICATIONS
PROGRAM.—Section :4{c)(7) of the Dingell-Johnson Sport Fish Res-
toration Act (16 U.8.C. 777¢(cX6)) is amended to read as follows:

. “(6) $7,499,997 for the penod of«October 1, 2004, through

June 30, 2005;”. ”

(b) CLEAN VESSEL ACT FUNDING -—Sectmn 4(b)}(4) of such Act
(16 U.S.C. T77c(b)4)) is amended to read as follows:

“(4) FIRST 9 MONTHS OF FISCAL YEAR 2005.—For the period
of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005, of the balance
of each annual ap ropnauon remaining after making the dis-
tribution under subsection (a), an amount equal to $61 499,997,
‘reduced by 82 percent of the amount appropriated for 'that
fiscal year from the Boat Safety "Account of the Aguatic

* Resources Trust Fund established by section 9504 of the

. Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to carry out the purposes of
section 13106(a} of title 46, Umted States Code, shall be used
as follows:

“(A) $7,499,997 shall ‘be available to the Secretary of
the Interior for 3 fiscal years’ for obligation for qualified
projects under section 5604(c) of the Clean Vessel Act of

- 1992 (33 U.S.C. 1322 note). “ ,

“(B) $6,000,000 shall be available to the Secretary of

the Interior for 3 fiscal yedrs for obligation for qualified

rojects under section 7404(d) of the Sportfishing and
oatm(g Safety Act of 1998 (16 U.S.C. T77e-1d).”

) The balance remaining after the application of

subpara%raphs (A) and: (B) shall be transferred to the Sec-

Transportation ‘and shall be expended for State

‘ recreatlonal boating safety rograms under section 13106

+ of title 48, United States Code.

16




. PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005 , .. 119 STAT. 335

(c) BoAT SAFETY FUNDS.—Section 13 106(c) of title 46, United
States Code, is amended— '
i (1) by striking-“$3,333,336" and 1nsert1ng “$3,750,003”; and
-(2) by stnkmg “$1,333 ,336” and msertmg “$1 500 003”

SEC. 9. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATION FOR 'USE OF TRUSI‘ FUNDS
FOR OBLIGATIONS UNDER TEA-21. Lo s

(a) HIGHWAY TRUST FUND—
(1) IN GENERAL. —--Paragraph (1) of sectwn 9503(c) of the -
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— 26 USC 9503.
(A) in the matter before subparagraph (A), by striking
“June 1, 2005” and inserting “July 1; 2005,
(B) by striking “or” at the. end of subparagraph {J),
(C) by stnkmg the peried at the end of subparagraph
: K)andmsertmg “ or”;
. (D) by inserting after subpa.rag‘raph (K) theifollowmg
R new subparagraph: ..
© o+ ° . " “L) authorized to’ be paid out of the H.lghway Trust
Fund under the Surface Transportatmn Extension-Act of
o " 2005.”, and -
ST (E) in the matter after subparagraph (L) as added
- by this paragraph, -by striking “Surface’ Transportation
Extension Act 0 2004 Part and msemng “Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2005": -
* (2) MASS TRANSIT ACCOUNT. —Paragraph 3 of section
9503(9) of such Code is amended—
- " {A) in the matter before subparagraph (A), by stnkmg
v “June 1, 2005” and inserting “July 1, 20057, -
e (B) in subparagraph (H) by stnkmg “or” at :the end
of such subparagraph
(C) in subparagraph (I), by msertmg or” at ‘the end
of such subparagraph,
(D) by inserting after subparagraph (I) the followmg
new subparagraph:
“J) the Surface Transportation Extension Act of

2005,”, and

(E) in the matter after subparagraph (J), as added
by this paragraph, by s “Surface Transportatmn
Extension Act of 2004, Part and inserting “Surface

Transportation Extension Act of 2005”.

(3) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON TRANSFERS.—Subpara-
gra h (B) of section 9503(b)(6) of such Code is amended by

“June 1, 2005” and inserting “July 1, 2005”.
(b) AQUATIC RESOURCES TRUST FUND.—

(1) SPORT FISH RESTORATION ACCOUNT.—Paragraph (2) of
section 9504(b) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is 26 USC 9504.
amended by striking “Surface Transportation Extension Act
of 2004, Part V” each place it appears and inserting “Surface
Transportatmn Extension Act of 2005”.

(2) BOAT SAFETY ACCOUNT.—Subsection (c} of section 9504
of such Code is amended-— ]

(A) by striking “June’ 1, 2005” and msertmg “July

1, 2005”, and ~ E

(B) by striking “Surface Transportatwn Extensmn Act
of 2004, Part V” and inserting “Surface Transportation

Extension Act of 2005”.

17




119 STAT. 336 - PUBLIC LAW 109-14—MAY 31, 2005

26 USC 9504

26 USC 4481.
26 USC 4482.

26 USC 4483.

26 USC 4481
note.

Termination
date.

-~ (3) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON TRANSFERS.—Paragraph
(2) of section 9504(d) of such Code is amended by siriking
“June 1, 2005” and inse “July 1, 2005";

(¢) EXTENSION OF TAX, ETC., ON USE OF CERTAIN HEAVY
VEHICLES.—The following . prowsmns of the Internal Revenue Code
of 1986 are each amended by striking “2005” each place it appears
and msertmge“2006” ,

(1) Section 4481(f).

{2) Section 4482(c)(4).

(3) Section 4482(d). -

(4) Section 4483(h).. - ,

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section
shall take effect on the date of the enactment of this Act.

(e) TEMPORARY RULE REGARDING ADJUSTMENTS.—During the

‘%a_nod beginning on the date of the enactment of the Surface

ansportation Extension Act of 2003 and ending on June 30,

_ ‘2005 for purposes of maklot‘llg any estimate under section 9503(d)
of the -Internal' Revenue Code .

of 1986 of receipts of the Highway
Trust Fund, the Secretary of the Treasury shall treat—-

(1) each e fg provision of paragraphs (1) through (4)
of section 9503(b) of such Code which is related to appropria-
tions or transfers to such Fund to have been extended through
~the end of the 24-month period referred to in section
"9503(d)X1)(B) of such Code, and . -

. (2) with respect.to each tax imposed under:the sections
referred to in section 9503(bX1) of such Code, the rate of such
d the .24-month period referred to in section
9503(d)(1)( ) of such Code to be the same as the rate of such
tax as in effect.on. the date of the enactment of the Surface
Transportatmn Extension Act ‘of 2003.]

' Approved May 31, 2005

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2566:

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 151 (2005):
May 25, considered and passed House.
May 26, consn‘lered and passed Senate

o

18




23 USC 101 note.

119 STAT. 346 . PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005

Public Law 109-20 © T

" :109th Congress

‘

An Act

- To'provide an extension  of highway, highway safety, motor carrier safety, transit,

and other programs funded out of the Highway Trust Fund pending enactment
of a law reauthorizing the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
” the United States of America in Congress assembled

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

. This Act may be cited as the “Surface Transportatmn Extension
Act of 2005, Part IT”. . ’
SEC. 2, ADVANCES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2(a)(1) of the Surface Transpoertation
Extension’ Act of 2004, Part V (23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat.
1144; 119 Stat. 324) is amended by striking a.nd the Surface
Transportatlon Extension Act of 2005” and inserting “, the Surface

- Transportation Extension Act of 2005, and the Surface Transpor-

tation Extension Act of 2005, Part IT".

(b) PROGRAMMATIC DISTRIBUTIONS.— -

(1) SPECIAL RULES FOR MINIMUM GUARANTEE.—Section
2(bX4) of such Act (119 Stat. 324) is amended by striking

' “$2,100,000,000” and inserting “$2,240,000,000".

.(2) EXTENSION OF OFF-SYSTEM BRIDGE SETASIDE.—Section
"144(gX3) of title 23, United States Code, i is a.mended by striking
“June 30" msertmg “July 19",

(c)  AUTHORIZATION OF CONTRACT ~ AUTHORITY.—Section
1101(1X1) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(118 Stat. '1145; 119 Stat. 324} is amended by striking
“$25,521,678,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through June
30, 2005” and inserting t)e 27,223,123,200 for the penod of October
1, 2004, through July 18, 2005

(d) LIMITATION ON OBLIGATIONS.—Section 2(e) of the Surface
Transportation - Extension Act of 2004, Part V' (118 Stat 1146;

23USC 104 note. ~ 119 Stat 324) is arpended—

(1)i m aragraph (1)—
(A) by striking “June 30" and msertmg “July 197
. ..(B) by striking “and the Surface Transportation "Exten-
sion Act of 2005” and inserting “, the Surface Transpor-
tation Extension Act of 2005, and the Surface Transpor-
tation Extension Act of 2005, Part IT”; and
(C} by striking “%2” and inserting “80 percent" and
(2) in paragraph (2)}—
(A) by striking “June. 30, 2005, shall not exceed
$26,025,000,000" and inserting “July 19 2005, shall not
. exceed $27 760 000 000”; and

19




' PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005 119 STAT. 347

(B) by striking “$479,250,000” and inserting
“$511 200, 000” and
Jr‘:'1(3{ in parag‘raph (3) by striking “June 30" and inserting
“duly

SEC. 3. ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.

Section 4(a) of the Surface Transpo rtation Extension Act of
2004, Part V (118 Stat 1147; 119 Stat. 325) is amended by strikin, 5
“hlghway % am” and all that follows through “2005”
inserting “highway program $281,619,200 for. ﬁsca.l year ~2005".

SEC. 4. OTHER FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAY PROGRAMS.

. 01, - (a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS UNDER TITLE 1 OF TEA-
- (1) FEDERAL LANDS HIGHWAYS.— -~
(A) INDIAN RESERVATION ROADS. ——-Sect.mn 1101(a)(8)(A)
of the Transportation Equity Act for the. 21st Century
(112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1147; 119 Stat. 325) is amended—
(i) in the first sentence by striking “$206,250,000 .
for the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, e
2005” and inserting “$220, 000, 000 for the period of - i
October 1, 2004, through July 19 20057; and
(ii) in the second sentence by stnkmg “$9,750,000”
and inserting “$10,400,000".
(B) PUBLIC LANDS HIGHWAYS “—Section 1101(a)(8)(B) of
~ guch Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119, Stat. 325)
is amended by striking “$184 500,000 for the period of
. October 1, 2004, through June 30 2005” and inserti
“$196,800,000 for the penod of October 1, 2004, throug
July 19, 2005”.
(C) PARK ROADS AND PARKWAYS.—Section 1101(a)X8)(C)
of such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 325)
is ‘amended by striking “$123,750,000 for. the period of
October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inse
“$132,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, throy,
July 19 2005"
(D) REFUGE ROADS.—Section 1101(aX8)(D) of such Act
(112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326) is amended
b stnkmg “$15,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
_ h June 30, 2005” and inserting “$16,000,000 for the
peno of Octoberl 2004, through July 19, 2005”.
(2} NATIONAL CORRIDOR PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT AND
COORDINATED BORDER INFRASTRUCTURE PROGRAMS.—Section
. 1101{a}{9) of such Act (112 Stat.” 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119
Stat. 326) is amended by striking “$105,000,000 for the pericd
of QOctober 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
‘igl]é% 350,9 000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
(3) CONSTRUCTION OF FERRY BOATS AND FERRY TERMINAL
FACILITIES.—
(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 1101(aX10) of such Act (112
Stat 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326) is amended by
' ﬁ “$28 500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
June 30, 2005” and inserting “$30,400,000 for the
penod of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”
(B) SET ASIDE FOR ALASKA, NEW JERSEY, AND WASH-
INGTON.—Section 5(aX3XB) of the Surface Transportation

20




119 STAT. 348

Effective date.

‘PUBLIC LAW. 109-20—JULY 1, 2005

Extension Act of 2004, Part. V (118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat.

326) is amended— v . . . ] '

" (i) in clause (i} by. striking “$7,500,000" and
inserting “$8,000,0007;, . - “o

i) in_clause (ii) by striking “$3,750,000” and
inserting “$4,000,0600”; and - . - -

- (iii) in clause (iil) -by striking “$3,750,000” and
inserting “$4,000,060". .- wow _

(4) NATIONAL SCENIC' :BYWAYS' PROGRAM.—Section
1101(aX11) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Cen-
tury (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat' -1148; 119 Stat. 326) is amended
by striking “$19,875,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,

-through June 30, 2005” and inserting “$21,200,000 for the
period of October 1, 2004; through July 19; 2005

(5) VALUE PRICING PILOT PROGRAM.—Section 1101(a)12)
of such Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326)
is amended by striking “$8,250,000 for ‘the period of Qctober
1, 2064, through June 30, -2005” and ‘inserting “$8,800,000

for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”.

{6) - HIGHWAY. USE “TAX' EVASION. PROJECTS.—Section
1101(a)X14) of such' Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119

"Stat.” 326) is amended by striking “$3,750,000 for the period

.- of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
", .“$4,000,000 for the period of October ‘1, 2004, through July
--19, 2605". | ’ : s .

(7) COMMONWEALTH OF PUERTO RICO HIGHWAY PROGRAM.—

. (A) TECHNICAL CORRECTION.—Effective. May 31, 2005,

* section 4(a}(7) of the Surface Transportation Extension Act

* of 2005 (119 Stat. 326) 'is amended ' by striking
. “1101(a)15)A)” and inserting “1101(a)(15)". . .

(B) 'INCREASED FUNDING.—Section 1101(aX15) of the

Transportation Equity Act for the 215t Century (112 Stat.

" 113; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat. 326) is amended by striking

“$82,500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through

June 30, 2005” and inserting “$88,000,000 for the period

‘of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”, -
‘(8) SAFETY GRANTS.—Section 1212(iX1XD) of such Act (23

JU.S.C. 402 note; 112 Stat. 196; 112 Stat. 840; 118 Stat. 1149;

119 Stat! 326) is amended by striking “$375,000 for the period
of October '1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and- inserting

,“$400,000 -for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 18,
'2005”, - 2 ' ,

" (9) TRANSPORTATION ~AND ' COMMUNITY.. AND. SYSTEM
PRESERVATION PILOT PROGRAM.—Section 1221(e)(1) of such Act
(23 U.S.C. 101 note; 112 Stat..223; 118.Stat. 1149; 119 Stat.
327) is amended by striking “$18,750,000 for the period of
October., 1,. 2004, ‘through -June 30, 2005” and inserting
“$20,0350,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
18,2005 . .. . Co.

- (10) . TRANSPORTATION - INFRASTRUCTURE FINANCE AND
INNOVATION.—Section 188 of title.23, United States Code, is
amended—. .. .., . ;o i

- (A) in subsection (a)(1).by striking subparagraph (G)
and inserting the following: -
“(G) $104,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,

t!.hrough'July 19, 2005.7;

21




" PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005 " 119 STAT. 349

(B) in subsection .(a)(2) by striking “$1,500,000 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2006” and
inserting “$1,600,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
through July 19, 20057, and S

Co (C) in the item relating to fiscal year 2005 in the
table contained in - subsection (c) b! striking
“$1,950,000,000” and inserting “$2,080,000,0007.

(11) NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS' CLEARINGHOUSE.—Section
- 1215(bX3) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century

{112 Stat. 210; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat. 327) is amended—

- (A) by striking“$1,125,000” and inserting “$1,200,0007;

and ) . an, i .

. - (B) by striking “June 30" and inserting “July 19”.
(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS UNDER TITLE V OF
(1) SURFACE TRANSPORTATION - RESEARCH.—Section
5001(aX1) of the Transgq;_‘i_:’ation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149; 119.-Stat, 327) is amended
by striking “$77,250,000 for, theé period of October 1, 2004,
through June 30, 2005” and.inserting “$82,400,000 for the

period of October-1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”. . .

(2)°' TECHNOLOGY DEPLOYMENT , PROGRAM.—Section
5001(a)2) of such Act (112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149; 119
Stat. 327),is amended by. striking “$37,500,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005" and inserting
“$40,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
18, 2005%. R

" (8) TRAINING AND EDUCATION.-~Section 5001(a)}(3) of such
© Act (112 Stat. 420, 118 Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327) is amended
by striking “$15,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
through . June 30, 2005” and- inserting “$16,000,000 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”.
. {4) BUREAU ' OF TRANSPORTATION, STATISTICS.—Section
5001(a)4} of such Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119
Stat. 327) is amended by striking “$23,250,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” ‘and inserting
’ ;%2%,3850,;000 for the period of October' 1, 2004, through July
. /(5) ITS STANDARDS, RESEARCH, OPERATIONAL TESTS, AND
DEVELOPMENT.—Section. 5001(a)}(5) of.such Act (112 Stat. 420;
118 "Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327) 'is amendéd by striking
“$82,500,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through June
30, 2005” and inserting “$88,000,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”., > - "¢
-~ (6) ITS DEPLOYMENT.—Section 5001(a}(6) of such Act (112
Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119"Stat. 327) is amended by striking
“$91,500,000 for the period of October 1; 2004, through June
- 30, 2005” and inserting “$97,600,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July 19,2005”. - @ -~ =~ F© )
{7) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH.—Section
~ 5001a)7) of such Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119
- Btat. 328) is amended by striking “$19,875,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
“$21,200,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
19, 2005". Gyt T
" (¢} METROPOLITAN PLANNING.—Section 5{c)1) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1150;

22




119 STAT. 350 PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1,-2005

- 119 Stat. 328} is.amended by striking “$163,125,000 for the period
- of October 1,:°2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
' “$174,000,000 for the period of October 1; 2004, through July 19,
2005", . .. . . - A
. (d) TERRITORIES.—Section 1101(d)X1) -of the Transportation
- Equity ‘Act for.the 21st Century (112 Stat. 111; 118 Stat. 1150;
.+119 -Stat. 328) is amended by striking “$27,300,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
“$29,120,000 -for- the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19,
2005”. , . . , . . .' . N .-
- (e) ALASKA HIGHWAY.—Section 1101(e)}(1) of such Act (118 Stat.
1150; 119 Stat. 328)’is .amended by striking “$14,100,000 for the
speriod of October 1, 2004, through June ‘30, 2005 and inserting
_51655,040,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19,
. 20 ,,. * . 1e N A N
-+ (f) OPERATION LIFESAVER.—Section 1101(f}1) of such Act (118
~Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 328) is amended by striking “$375,000 for
the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
“$400,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005,
' *(g) BRIDGE DISCRETIONARY.-——Section 1101(gX1) of such Act (118
Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 328) is amended— - R
(1) by striking “$75,000,000” and inserting “$80,000,000”;

and . .
(2) by striking “June 30” and inserting “July 19”. ©=
(h) INTERSTATE MAINTENANCE.—Section 1101(hX1) of such Act
" (118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 328) is amended— - °
T q (1) by striking “$75,000,000” and inserting “$80,000,000™;
an
(2) by striking “June 30” and inserting “July 19°. . .
(i) RECREATIONAL TRAILS ADMINISTRATIVE CosTs.—Section
; 1101(iX1) of such Act (118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 328), is amended
by striking “$562,500 for the period of.October 1, 2004, through
dJune 30, 2005” and inserting “$600,000 for the period .of. October
1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”. . J N
(> RAILWAY-HIGHWAY CROSSING HAZARD ELIMINATION IN HIGH
SPEED Ran. CORRIDORS.—Section 1101(j)(1) of such Act (118 Stat.
1151; 119 Stat. 328) is amended— - G .
(1) by striking “$3,937,500” and inserting “$4,200,0007;
. (2) by striking “$187,500” and inserting “$200,000™ and
J‘ﬂ(3%é:y striking “June 30" each place'it appedrs and inserting
“July 197. - . .- .
(k) NONDISCRIMINATION. ~Section 1101(k).of such Act (118 Stat.
1151; 119 Stat. 328) is amended— S . o
(1) in paragraph (1) by striking “$7,500,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005”. and inserting
“$8,000,000 for the period of October 1, :2004; through ‘July
19, 2005”; and L. . .
. {2) in paragraph (2) by striking “$7,500,000 for the period
- of October 1, 2004, through June- 30, 2005 and inserting
“ss,gggéooo for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
19, 2005”. K Pt
() ADMINISTRATION. OF FUNDs.—Section. 5(1).of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1151;
119 Stat. 329)-is amended— . ' ' e o
(1) by striking “and section 4 of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005” and inserting “, section 4 of the Surface

23




. PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005 ‘119 STAT. 351

Transportation Extension Act of 2005, and ‘section 4 of the
Surface tnEu't.at;mn Extension’ Act -of 2005, Part II”; and
. 2) by s ng “the amendment made by ‘subsection (a)(1)
of this section or the amendment made by section 4(a}1) of
. +such Act” and inserting “the amendments made by subsection
{a) of this section, section 4(a) of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005 and section 4(a) of the Surface Transpor-
tation Extension Act of 2005, Part II”. . -
(m) REDUCTION OF ALLOCATED PROGRAMS. — Section 5(m) of
such Act (118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 329) is amended—

. (1) by striking “and section 4 of the Surface Transportatwn
Extensmn Act of 2005” and inserting “, section 4 of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2005, and section 4 of the
Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part 117, -

(2) by striking “and by section 4 of such Act® the first
ace it appears and inserting %, section 4 of the Surface
}I)'ransportatmn Extension Act of 2005, and section 4 of the

, Surface ’I‘ransportatwn Extension Act, Part " and .- .
(3) by striking “and by sectlon 4 of such Act”.the. second
ace it appears and inserting section 4.'of. the Surface
g‘ransportatmn Extension Act of 2005, and section 4 of,the

Surface Transportation Extension Act, Part ",

(n) PROGRAM CATEGORY RECONCILIATION.—Section 5(n).of such
Act (118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 329) is amended by striking “and
section 4 of the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005”
- and inserting “, section 4 of the Surface Transportation Extension
Act of 2005, and sectmn 4 of the Surface Transportation Extension

Aet, Part It”,
SEC 5. EXTENSION OF HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.

(a) CHAPTER 1 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.— '

: " (1) SEAT BELT SAFETY INCENTIVE GRANTS. —Sectmn 157(gX1)

' of title 23, United States Code, is amended by striking
‘“$84 000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through June
30, 2005” and inserting “$89,600,000 for the penod of October
1, 2004; through July 19, 2005”.

" (2) PREVENTION. OF INTOXICATED DRIVER -INCENTIVE
GRANTS.-~Section 163(eX1) of such title is amended by striking
“$82,500,000 -for the period of October 1, 2004, through June
30, 2005” and' inserting “$88,000,000 for the penod of October

- 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005".

(b) CHAPTER 4 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.—Section 2009(aX1)
of the Transportation Equity Act for the 215t Century (112 Stat.
337; 118 Stat. 1152; 119 Stat. 329) is amended by striking

-“$123 750,000 for . the period of October 1, 2004, through June
‘30, 2005 and inserting “$132,000, 000 for the period of October
1, 2004 through July 19, 2005”., :

(c) HIGHWAY SAFETY RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT —Section
2009(8)(2) of such Act (112:Stat. 337; 118 Stat. 1152; 119 Stat.
329) is amended by striking “$54,000, 000 for the penod of October
1, 2004, through June 30, 2005 and inserting “$57,600,000 for
the penod of October 1, 2004 through July 19, 2005”. -

(d) OCCUPANT PROTECTION INCENTIVE -GRANTS.—Section
2009(3)(3) of such Act (112 Stat. 337, 118 Stat. 1152; 119 Stat.
329) is amended hy striking “$15,000,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and.inserting “$16,000,000 for

- the penod of October 1, 2004 through July 19, 2005”.

24




119 STAT. 352 PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005

- (¢) ALCOHOL-IMPAIRED DRIVING COUNTERMEASURES INCENTIVE
GRANTS.—Section 2009(aX4) of such Act (112 Stat. 337; 118 Stat.
:.. 1153; 119 Stat. 329) is amended by_striking “$30,000,000 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005” and inserting
2%%25,,900,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19,
(D) NATIONAL DRIVER REGISTER.— .
. (1) FUNDING.—Section 200%(a)(6). of such Act (112 Stat.
338; 118 Stat. 1153; 119 Stat. 330) is amended by striking
“$2,700,000 for the period of October -1, 2004, through June
30, 2005” and inserting “$2,880,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”. . .

(2) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Funds made available by the
amendments made by paragraph (1) and by section 5(F) of
the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005 (119 Stat.
330) shall be available for obligation in the same manner as
if such funds were.apportioned under: chapter 1 of title 23,
United States Code. - ..

S8EC. 6. FEDERAL MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY ADMINISTRATION PRO-
GRAM. . ' : .

{a) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section 7{a}1} of the Surface

- Transportation' Extension Act of 2004, 'Part V (118 Stat. 1153;

119 Stat. 330) is amended by striking “$192,631,044 for the period

of QOctober 1, 2004, through K June. 30,  2005” and inserting

;%20059,037,600 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19,

(b) MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY ASSISTANCE PROGRAM.—Section
31104(a)(8) of title 49, United States Code, is amended to read
as follows: ’ : : ) N

“(8) Not more than $135,200,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July 19, 2005.”. :

G (c) INFORMATION SYSTEMS AND COMMERCIAL DRIVER'S LICENSE
RANTS.— . ° .- _
(1) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATION.—Section 31107(a)
- of such title is amended by striking “(5) $14,958,904 for the
peried of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005.” and inserting
the following:-- - ‘ )

“(6) $16,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through
July 19,20057. ° - : : -

(2) EMERGENCY CDL GRANTS.—Section -7{c)(2) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1153;
119 Stat. 330) is amended— R e

(A) by striking “June 30” and inserting “July 19”; and
(B) by striking “$747,945” and inserting “$800,000”.
(d) CrasH CAUSATION STUDY.—Section 7(d) of such Act (118
Stat. 1154; 119 Stat. 330) is amended— T
" (1} by striking “$747,945” and inserting “$800,000"; and
(2) by striking “June 30” and inserting “July 19”.
" 'SEC. 7. EXTENSION OF FEDERAL TRANSIT PROGRAMS.

(a) ALLOCATING AMOUNTS.—Section 5309(m) of title 49, United
. ‘States Code, is amended— - .. -
(1) in the matter preoeding ubj)aragraph (A).of paragraph
an

(1) by striking “June 30, 2005” and inserting “July 19, 2005™

(2) in paragraph (2XBXiii}— .
. (A) in. the heading by striking “JUNE 30, 2005” and
inserting “JULY 19, 2005, - - & . -

25




PUBLIC LAW 103-20—JULY 1, 2005 + .119 STAT: 353

4 (B) by stnkmg “$7,800,000” and msertmg #$8,320,000™;
an
() by stnking “June 30, 20057 and msertmg “July
19, 2005”; . .
= (3) in aragraph (3XB)}—
(A) by stnkmg “$2 250,000” and msertmg “$2, 400 0007;

. (B) by striking “June 30, 2005" and inserting “July
19, 2005”; and
(4)in Azaragraph (3 C)— )
striking  “$37,500, 000" and inserting
“$40 000 000” and
1, 2({])535Ey stnkmg “June 30, 2005 and msertmg “July

* (b) FORMULA GRANTS AUTHORIZATIONS: -——Sectmn 5338(a} of title
‘49, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in the headmg to parag;raph (2) by stnkmg “JUNE 30,

2005” and inserting “JULY 18, 2005

(2)in Xaragraph (2XAXvii
striking “$2 545 785,000 and inserting
“$2,675, 300 000”; and. .
19, 2((])30)5,l’)y stnkmg “June 30, 2005” and inserting “July
(3) in paragraph (2)(B)(vn) by stnkmg “June 30, 2005”
-and inserting “July 19, 2005”; and
(4) in Jparagraph (2XC) hy striking "June 30, 2005” and

inserting “July 19, 2005".

(c) FORMULA GRANT FUNDS—Section 8(d) of ‘the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1155;
., 119 Stat. 331) is amended—

‘ (1) in the heading by striking “JUNE 30, 2005 and inserting
“JuLy 19, 20057,
(2) in the matter precedmg paragraph (1) by stnkmg “June
.+ 30, 2005” and inserting “July 19, 2005”;
o (3} in paragraph 1) by stnk.mg “$3 637, 462” and inserting
“$3,879,960";
$40(4) in paragraph (2) by Btnk.mg “$37 500 000” and inserting
“ 000,
' (6) in paragraph (3) by stnkmg “$73 197, 001” and inserting
-.,,“$76 231,2017,
(6) in paragraph (4) by stnking “$194,277 040" and
se?'?)rlg s 3301? 1{2')’ by striking “$5, 212,500” and insertin,
in paragrap Yy 5 “ ” and inse .
“$5,560,000”; and ¢
. (8) in paragraph (6) by stnkmg “$2, 782 400,997" and
inserting “$2,897,738,526".
(d) CAPITAL PROGRAM AUTHORIZATIONS —Sectmn 5338(b)(2) of

" title 49, United States Code, is amended—-

(1) in the heading by striking “JUNE 30, 2005 and inserting
“JULY 19, 2005”;
{Z)msubpa.ragra h (AXvii)— .
(A) by strking “$2,012, 985 000” and inserting
“$2,235,820,000”; and
. (B) by stnkmg “June 30, 2005” and inserting “July
19, 2005” and
(3) in Bubgaragraph (B)(vn) by stnkmg “June 30, 2005”
and inserting “July 19, 2005°. -

26




- 119 STAT. 354 PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005

(e} PLANNING AUTHORIZATIONS. AND ALLOCATIONS.—Section
- 5338(cK2) of title 49, Urited States Code, is amendedw
(1) in the headmg by striking “JUNE 30, 2005” and inserting
“JULY 19, 2005™; . ‘
(2)in subparagraph (AXvii)— C
. (A) by striking | “$48 346 668” " and inserting
“$47 946,667"; and '
. (B) by stnkmg “June 30, '2005” and inserting “July
19, 2005"; and
(3) in sub aragraph (B)(vu) by stnkmg “June 30, 2005”
and inserting “July 19,2005”." -
. (0) RESEARCH AUTHORIZATIONS —-—Sectlon 5338(dX2) of title 49,
_ United States Code, is amended— - °
o (1)in the headmg by striking “JUNE 30, 2005 and inserting
“JULY 19, 2005"; o
(2) in subparagraph (AXvii)— _
(A) by striking “$32,683, 333” - and- -inserting
“$36 933,334"; and
19, 2(0B0)5’l’)y stnkmg “June 30, 2005” and inserting “July
(3) in subparagraph (BXvii) 'by stn]nng “June 30, 2005
and inserting “July 19, 2005”; and

- (4) in subparagraph © by striking “June 30 2005” and

ingerting “July 19, 2005”.

{g) ALLOCATION OF RESEARCH FUNDS.—Section 8(h) of the Sur-
face Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1156;
119 Stat. 332) ig'amended-—- -

(1) in the heading by strkag “JUNE 30, 2005” and msertmg

“JuLy 19, 20067,

(2) in the matter precedmg paragraph (1)-by stnkmg “June

30, 2005” and inserting “July 19, 20057;

(3 in paragraph (1) by stnkmg “$3, 937 500” and inserting

“$4,200, 0007;

{4) in paragraph (2) by stnkmg “$6, 187 500” and inserting

“$6,600,000"; and

(5)1 m aragraph (8}~ ..
(A) by striking “$3, 000 000” and msertmg “$3 200,0007;

(B) by striking “$750 000" and ingerting “$800,000”.
(h) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH AUTHORIZATIONS -
Sectmn 5338(e)(2) of title 49, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in the heading by stnkmg JUNE 30, 2005”7 and msertmg

“JULY 19, 2005™; ,

(2)in subpam
. d g $3 700,000 a.nd msertulg “$4, 000 000™;

an

18, 2((1)335’133! striking “June 30 2005” and msertmg “July

(3) in subparagraph (B) by stnkmg “June 30 2005”" and
- ingerting “July- 19, 2005”; and -

(4) in subparagraphs (C)i) and (C)(m) by striling “June
- 30, 2005” and inserting “July 19, 2005". .1
4)) ALLOCAT[ON OF UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH

S_

(1) In GENERAL —Section 8() of the Surface Transportatmn
Extension Act. of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1157 119 Stat. 332)
is amended— R e o

27




- PUBLIC-LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005 119 STAT. 355

(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A) of para-

graph (1)'by striking “June 30, 20057 and inserting “July
- 19, 2005” ’

(B) in paragraph (1)(A) by stnkm‘g “$1 500,000" and
inserting “$1,600,0007;

"(C) in paragraph (1)B) by striking “$1,500,000” and
inserting “$1,600,000”; and

(D) in paragraph (2) by striking “June 30, 2005” and

.- inserting “July 19, 2005”.

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Settion 3015(d)(2) of the
‘I‘ransportatwn Equity Act for the 2ist Century (49 U.S.C.
5338 note; 112 Stat. 857; 118 Stat. 1157;119 Stat. 332) is
amended by striking “June 30, 2005” and msertmg “July 19,
2005".

j) ADMINISTRATION AUTHORIZATIONS. -——Sectmn 5338(£)(2) of title

. 49, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in the headmg by striking “JUNE 30, 2005” and inserting

“JULY 18, 20057;

(2)in subparagraph (AXvii)}— .
(A) by . striking “$48 100, 000” _'and, inserting
“$52 000,0007; and :
... (B by stnkmg “June 30 2005” and’ msertmg “July -
19, 2005”; and .

. (3) in subparagraph {B)vii) by stnkmg “June 30 2005™

and inserting “July 19, 2005".

(k) JoB ACCESS AND REVERSE C()MMU"I‘E PROGRAM. —Section
3037(1) of the Transportation Equity, Act for the 21st Century (49
U.8.C. 5309 note 112 Stat. 391; {18 Stat. 1157; 119 Stat. 333)
is amended— )

(1) in aph (1)(A)(vu)——
. ( ) striking  “$92,500, 000" and inserting

“$80,000, 000" and

T (B) by stnkmg “June 30, 2005" and msertmg “July

19, 2005";

(2) in paragraph {1XBXvii) by st:nkmg “June 30, 20057
and inserting “July 19, 2005”; and

(3) in paragraph (@) by stnking “June 30, 2005, not more
than $7,500,000” and msertmg “July 19, 2005 not more than
$8,000,000". :

- ..()" RURAL TRANSPORTATION Accnssmxm INCENTIVE PRoO-
GRAM.—Section 3038(g) of the Transportation Equity Act for the
21st Century (49 U.S.C. 5310 note; 112 Stat. 393 118 Stat 1158;
119 Stat. 333) is amended—

* - . . (1) by striking paragraph (1)(G) and msemng after para-

graph (1)(F) the following

“G) $4, 200 000 for' the period of chober 1, 2004,
through July 19, 2005.”; and
S A{2)in farag'raph (2)— ,
(A) by stnkmg “$1,275, 000” and inserting “$1 360,0007;

1, 2((])3)5by stnklng “June 30, 2005 and msertmg “July
q 0 LI U

{(m) URBANIZED AREA FORMULA GRANTS.—Section -5307(bX2)
of tltle 49, United States Code, is amended— :

e - (1) in the heading by striking “JUNE 80, 2005” and inserting
“JULY 19, 2005"; and

28




119 STAT. 356 ~PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005

23 USC 322 note.

(2) in subparagraph (A) by striking “June 30, 2005” and

inserting “July 19, 2005”. . - | i | oo-

(n) OBLIGATION CEILING.—Section 3040(7) of the Transportation
Equity Act for the 21st Century (112 Stat. 394; 118 .Stat. 1158;
119 Stat. 333) is amended— = - - on T f

» (1) by striking -“$5,818,500,000” . and~ inserting

“$6,166,400,000”; an LT S A

(2) by striking “June’ 30, 2005” and inserting “July 19,
2005°. .. . ' : LT

(o) FUEL CELL Bus AND Bus FACILITIES: PROGRAM.—Section
3015(b) ' of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
{112 Stat. 361; 118 Stat. 1158; 119 Stat. 333) is amended—

(1) by striking “June 30,:2005”. and inserting “July 19,

2005” and - - L R

(2) by striking “$3,637,500” and inserting “$3,880,000".. -

(p) ADVANCED TECHNOLOGY ‘PILOT PROJECT.—Section 3015(cX2)
of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century (49 U.S.C.
322 note; 112 Stat. 361; 118 Stat. 1158; 119 Stat. 334) is amended—

(1) by striking “June’30, 2005,” and inserting “July 19,

20057; and T

(2) by striking “$3,750,000” and inserting “$4,000,000”.

(@) PROJECTS FOR NEW FIXED GUIDEWAY SYSTEMS AND EXTEN-
SIONS TO EXISTING SYSTEMS.—Subsections’ (d), -(b), and (c)1) of
section 3030 of the Transportation Equity Act for‘the 21st Century
(112 Stat. 373; 118 Stat. 1158; 119 Stat. 334) are amended by
striking “June 30, 2005” and inserting “July 19,2005

(r) NEw JErsSEYy URBAN CORE PROJECT.-——Subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C) of section 3031(aX3) of the Intermodal Surface

- Transportation Efficiency Act of 1991 (105 Stat. 2122; 118 Stat.

1158; 119 Stat. 334) are amended bfy"strik@hg “June 30, 2005”

. and iriserting “July 19, 2005”. o -
© " (8) LOCAL SHARE.—Section 3011(a) of the Transportation Equity

Act for the 21st Century (49 U.S.C, 5307 note; 118 Stat. 1158;
119 Stat. 334) is’amended by striking “June 30, 2005” and inserting
“July 19, 2005". ' : | S

SEC. 8. SPORT FISHING AND BOATING SAFETY.

(2) FUNDING FOR NATIONAL OUTREACH AND COMMUNICATIONS
PROGRAM.—Section 4(c) of the Dingell-Johnson Spert Fish Restora-
tion Act (16 U.S.C. 777c(c)) is amended by striking “(6) $7,499,997
for the period of October 1, 2004, through June 30, 2005;” and
inserting the following: T

. “(7) $8,000,000 for the period of Octobeér 1, 2004, through

July 19, 2005;”. e T

(b) CLEAN VESSEL ACT FUNDING.—Section.4(bX4) of such Act
(16 U.8.C, 777c¢(bX4)) is amended to read as follows: .. .

“(4) FIRST 292 DAYS OF FISCAL YEAR 2005.—For the period
of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005, of the balance
of each annual appropriation remaining after making the dis-
tribution under. subsection (a), an amount equal to $65,600,000,
reduced by 82 percent of the amount appropriated for that
fiscal year from the -Boat Safety Account of the Aquatic
Resources ~Trust Fund established by section® 9504 of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to carry out the purposes of
sec};iﬁn 13106{a) of title 46, United States Code, shall be used
as follows: S : .

P

29




. PUBLIC LAW. 109-20—JULY 1, 2005 119 STAT. 357

“(A) $8,000,000 shall be available to the Secretary of

the Interior for 3 fiscal years for obligation for qualified

. projects ‘under section” 5604(c) of .the Clean Ve Act of
1992 (33 U.S.C. 1322 note).

“B) $6,400,000 shall be available to the Secretary of
the Inbenor for 3.fiscal years for obligation for qualified
gro_]ects under section 7404(d) of the Sportfishing and

Safety Act of 1998 (16 U.S.C. 77 751—1(d))
“(C) The balance remaining after the application of
ca T subpara%raphs {A) and (B) shall be transferred to the Sec-
- -retary o portation and shall be expended . for State
recreational boating safety dprograms under section 13106
of title 46, United States Co
(c) BOAT SAFETY FUNDS —Sect:lon 13106(c) of title 46, United
States Coede, is amended—
_ (1) by striking “$3,750, 003” and msertmg “$4,000,000”; and
(2) by striking “$1, 500, 003” and inserting “$1 600, 000”.

SEC. 9. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATION FOR USE OF TRUST FUNDS
FOR OBLIGATIONS UNDER TEA-31. '

(a) HiGHWAY TRUST.FUND.— | -
: (1) IN GENERAL. —Paragraph (1) of section '9503(c) of the
5 Intemal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— 26 USC 9503.
- (A) in the matter before subparagraph (A) by striking
“July 1, 2005” and inserting “July 20, 20057,
(B) by 'striking “or” at the end of subtparagraph (K),
(C) by stnkmg the period at-the end o subparagraph
(L) and-inserting “, or”,
- {D) by. msertmg after subparagraph (L) the following
new subparagraph:
: *"%M) authorized to be paid out of the nghway Trust
 Fund under the Surface Transportation Extension Act of
© 2005, Part I1.”, and
' (E) in the matter after subparagraph (M), as added
this paragra ‘ph by striking “Surface Transportation
E);‘tenmon Act of 2005” and inserting “Surface anspor-
tation Extension Act of 2005, Part IT".- . -
(2) MASS TRANSIT ACCOUNT. ——-Paragraph {3) of section
9503(e) o(ff)uch Chode is ameglg_ed-—- ’ b B (A, b
e in the matter before subparagrap y striking
“July 1, 2005 and inserting “July 20, 2005”, -
(B} ‘in subparairaph (I), by stnkmg “or” at the end
of such subparagraph,
(C) in subparagraph (J), by inserting “or" at the end
of such subparagraph,
(D) by inserting after subparagraph (J) the following
new subparagraph:
' “(K) the Surface Transporl:atwn Extensmn "Act of 2005,
Part II,", and
(E) in the matter aﬁ:er subparagraph (K) as’ added
paragraph, by striking “Surface Transportatmn
Eg:benalon Act o 2005 ‘and inserting “Surface Transpor-
tation Extension Act of 2005, Part 117,
(3) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON TRANSFERS —Subpara-
graph (B) of section 9503(b)6) of such Code is amended by
g “July 1, 2005” and inserting “July 20, 2005" :
{b) AQUATIC RESOURCES TRUST FUND.—

30




26 USC 9504.

26 USC 9503
note.

" 119 STAT. 358 PUBLIC LAW 109-20—JULY 1, 2005

(1) SPORT FISH RESTORATION ACCOUNT.—Paragraph (2) of
section 9504(b) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended by striking “Surface Transportation Extension Act
of 2005” each place it appears and inserting “Surface Transpor-
tation Extension Act of 2005, Part I1”.

(2) BOAT SAFETY ACCOUNT.—Subsection {c) of section 9504
of such Code is amended—

2005(,1.\) bg striking “July 1, 2005” and inserting "July 20,

(B) by striking “Surface Transportatmn ‘Extension Act
of 2005 and msertmg “Surface Transportation Extension

Act of 2005, Part 11", -

(3) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON TRANSFERS.—Paragraph
(2) of section 9504(d) of such Code is amended by striking
“July 1, 2005” and inserting “July 20, 2005”,

(c) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section

. shall take effect on the date of the enactment of this-Act.

(d) TEMPORARY RULE REGARDING ADJUSTMENTS. ——-Durmg the
%3_ riod beginning on the date of the enactment of the Surface
ansportation Extension Act of 2003 and ending on July 19, 2005,

. for pm;ﬁ\oses of making any estimate under section 9503(d) of the

Internal Revenue Code of 1986 of receipts of the Highway Trust
Fund, the Secretary of the Treasury shall treat—

(1) each expiring provision of paragraphs {1) through (4)
of section 950;&) of such. Code which is related to ?propna-
tions or transfers to such Fund to have been extéended through
the end of .the 24-month period referred to in section
9503(d)(1XB) of such Code, and

(2) with respect to each tax imposed under the sections
referred to in section 9503(bX1) of such Code, the rate of such
tax during the 24-month period referred to in section
9503(d)(1XB) of such Code to be the 'same as the rate of such
tax as in effect on the date of the enactment’ of the Surface

* Transportation Extensmn Act of 2003 ‘

Approved July 1, 2005.

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 3104: = . o
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 151 (2005): .
June 30, considered and passed House and Senate, -

O




. PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005 . 119 STAT. 379
!, .
Public Law 109-35 c
109th Congress ..° o T
- An Act :

" To provide an extension of highway highway safety, motor carrler safety transit, July 20, 2005
"* and other programs furided out of the Highway Trust Fund pending enactment Yy <4

of alaw reauthmizing the Transportatlon Equiity Act for the Z1st Century. ' [H.R. 3332]

Be it enacted by :the Senate and House of Repmsentatives of T

the United States of America in Congmss assembled, - Surface
i . Transportation
Extension Act of

”'-,SEC'I'IONI suon"r'rn'us S o :‘ -
. This Act may be cited as the- “Surface Transportation Extension H““SSE“{},PIM
* Act of 2005, Part IIT", . .

SEC. 2. ADVANCES,

_ (a} IN GENERAL ~_Section Z(a)(l) of the Surface Transportation

.Extension Act of 2004, Part V ,(23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat.
1144; 119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346) is amended g'strikin “and
the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005, :Part. II" and
inserting “, the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part
II, and the Surface Transportation ‘Extension Act of 2005, Part

-,

(b) PROGRAMMATIC DISTRIBUTIONS.—

. (1) SPECIAL RULES FOR MINIMUM GUARANTEE. —Section

2(b}(4) of such Act (119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346) is amended

by striking “$2,240,000,000" and inserting “$2,268,000,000".

(2) SION OF OFF-SYSTEM BRIDGE SETASIDE.—Section
144(g) (3) of title 23, United States Code, is amended by striking
“July 19" inserting “July 21".

{c) AUTHORIZAT ON "OF CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Section
1101{1){1} of the Trans gartation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(118 Stat. 1145; 119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346} is_amended z
strildn “$27,223,123,200 for the period of October 1, 2004, throug
July 19, 2005" and mserting “$27,563,412,240 for the period of
October 1, 2004, through July 21, 2005".

(d} LIMITATION ON OBLIGATIONS.—Section 2(38 of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1146:
119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346) is amended— 23 USC 104 nate.

(1) mAaaragra ph (1)—

) by striking "July 19" and inserting “July 217
(B) by striking “and the Surface Transportation Exten-
sion Act of 2005, Part H" and insertin the Surface

Transportation Extension Act of 2005. Part II, and the

Su‘ti'face Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part III";

an

{©) Jv striking. “80 perc_er_it_. and inserting “80.8 per-
cent”; an

@) in paragraph (2)—

y L

32




“119°-STAT. 380 PUBLIC LAW 109-35—-JULY 20, 2005

(A) 0% striking - "July 19, 2005, shall not exceed
$27,760,060,000" and msertmg “July: 21 2005, shall not
exceed $28,107,000,000"; and
“(B) by striking .“$511,200, 000 and inserting
“$517,590,000"; and
. l(3) in paragraph (3) by strikmg July 19" and inserting
1) uy
SEC. 3. ADM]NISTRATIVE EXPENSES

Section 4(a) of the Surface Transportation Extension Act of
2004, Part V (118 Stat 1147; 119 Stat. 325: 119 Stat. 346) is
amended by striking “$281, 619,200" and inserting “$285,139,440".

SEC. 4. OTHER FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAY PROGRAMS..
- {a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS UNDER Tl'I‘LE I OF TEA-

21— :
1) FEDERAL LANDS HIGHWAYS —
: {A) INDIAN RESERVATION ROADS —Sectlon 1101(a)(8){A)
. of the Transportation Equity Act. for. the 2lst Century
(112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1147; 119 Stat +325; 119 Stat.
. 346) is amended—:. .
. (i) in the first sentence. by strik.mg “$220,000,000
for the period of October .1, 2004, through July 19,
"2005" and inserting "“$222,750,000 for- the period of
October 1, 2004; through Juily 21, 2005™; and .
(ii) in the second sentence by  striking
“$10,400,000" and inserting “$10,530,000".
(B) PUBLIC LANDS HIGHWAYS.—Section 1101(a)(8){B) of
such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 325,
119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking “$196,800,000 for
the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”
and inserting “$199,260, 000 for the period o October 1,
2004, through July 21, 2005".
(C} PARK ROADS AND’ PARKWAYS —Sectjon 1101(a) 8)(C)
of siich Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 325;
119 Stat. 346) is-amended by striking “$132,000,000 for
the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19; 2005"
and Inserting-“$133,650, 000 for the period o October 1,
2004, throu Jul 21, 2005", :
(D) RE OADS.—Section 1101(a)(8) D) of such Act
{112 Stat. 112 ‘118 Stat. 1148:.119 :Stat. 326; 119 Stat.
346) is amended by striking “$16,000,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004; through July 19, 2005” and insertin ﬁ
“$16,200,000 for the period of October .l 1 2004, throug
July 21, 2005".
(2) NATIONAL CORRIDOR PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT AND
« COORDINATED BORDER INFRASTRUCTURE- PROGRAMS.—Section
1101{a){9) of such Act (112 -Stat. 112;-118 Stat. 1148: 119
Stat. 326; 119 Stat. 346} is amended by strikin “$112 000,000
for the’ period of .October 1, 2004, through y 19, 2005”
and msertmg2 “$ E}}% gOO 000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
1 . .
CO STRUCTION OF FERRY BOATS AND* FERRY TERMINAL
FACILITIES——
(A) IN GENERAL -—Sectaon 1101(a)(10) of such Act (112
Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326; 119 Stat. 346)
is amended’ by striking “$30,400,000: for the period of
October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005" and inserting

33




. “PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005 119 STAT. 381

“$30,780,000 for the :period- of October 1, 2004, through
July 21, 2005".

(B) SET ASIDE FOR ALASKA, NEW JERSEY, AND WASH-
INGTON.—Section 5(a)(3)(B) of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1148 119 Stat.
326; 119 Stat, 346} is amended—'

() in clause (i) by striking "$8 000,000" and
inserting “$8,100,000™;
{if} in clause (ﬂ) by striking “$4 000,000" and
inserting “$4,050,000"; and
(iif) in ‘clause (1ii) by striking 54 000 000" and
inserting “$4,050,000",
(4) NAT[ONAL SCENIC BYWAYS PROGRAM.—Section
1101(a)(11) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Cen-
(112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326; 119 Stat.
ug is amended by striking “$21,200,000 for the period of
October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005". and inserting
.“$21,465, GOO for the period of October 1, 2004, thnough July
~21, 2005".
(5 VALUE PRICING PILOT PROGRAM —Section 1101(2)(12)
" of such-Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 ‘Stat, 1148; 119 Stat. 326;
119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking “$8,800,000 for the period
of Octeber 1, 2004; through July 19, 2005" and inserting
“$8, 9105000 for ‘the period of October 1, 2004, through July
21, 200 .
{6 HIGHWAY USE 'TAX EVASION PROJECTS.—Section
llOl(a)(l4) of such Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119

"', Stat. 326; 119, Stat. 346) is amended by striking “$4,000,000

for, the perlod ‘of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005”
. and inserting “$4,050,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,

through July 21, 2005".
( COMMONWEALTH QF PUERTO RICO HIGHWAY PROGRAM.—

| :Section 1101(a)(15) of the Transportation Equity Act for the

< - 21st.Century (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1149; 118 Stat. 326;

.1+ 119 Stat. 346).is amended by striking "$88,000,000 for the
. period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005" and inserting
‘$89, mg ,000 for the period of October, 1, 2004, through July
. 21,2005 -

(8) SAFETY* GRANTS —Section ; lZlZ(i)(l)(D) of such Act (23
. U.S.C. 402 note; 112 Stat. 196; 112 Stat.- 840; 118 Stat. 1149;
119 Stat. 326; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking "$400,000
for the period- of .October -1, 2004, .through July 19, 2005”
and inserting “$405,000 for the period o? October 1, 2004,
" throu July 21, 20057

9)- " TRANSPORTATION - AND COMMUNITY AND SYSTEM
PRESERVATION PILOT PROGRAM.—Section 1221{e)(1) of such Act
(23 U.S.C. 101 note; ‘112 Stat. 223; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat.
327; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by:striking “$20,000,000 for
the period ‘of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005" and
inserting “$20,2590,000 for the period of ctoberl 2004, through
July 21, 2005".

(10) TRANSPORTATION INFRASTRUCTURE . FINANCE AND
INNOVATION.—Section 188 of titie. 23 United States Code, is
amended—-

© 1 (A) in subsection (a)(1) by striking subparagraph (G)
. and inserting the following: . .

34




119 STAT. 382

.PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY .20, 2005

*(G). $105,300,000 for the period of October. 1, 2004,
thrm(zg)h July 21, 2005.™;

in subsection (a) {2) by striking * '$1, 60{] 000 for the

period of October 1, 2004, through July. 19, 2005”7 and

inserting “$1,620, 000 for the period of October 1, 2004,

throu July 21,2005"; and. ...

(G} in the item relatmg to ﬁscal year. '2005 in table
contained in subsection (c) by stnking $2 080,000,000"
and inserting *'$2,106,000,000".

(11) NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS CLEARI.NGHOUSE —Section
1215(b)(3) of the Transportation Eq %Act for the 21st Cen
(112 Stat. 210; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346
. is amended—

(A) by striking * $1,200,000" and inserting “$1, 215 0007;
and
strlkin(? ‘July 19" and inserting “Jul
(b) AUTHO TION OF APPROPRIATIONS ER E V OF
l LI i - N "

(1) SURFACE  TRANSPORTATION - RESEARCH.—Section
5001{a)(1) of the Transpertation Equity Act for the 21st Centu
(112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 34

" is amended by striking :'$82,400,000 for the period of October

"1, 2004, through July 18, 2005" and inserting “$83,430,000

for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 21,'2005".

()  TECHNOLOGY DEPLOYMENT  PROGRAM.—Section
5001(a){2) of such Act (112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149; 119
Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by strikln “$4U 000,000
for the perfod of October 1, 2004, through 19, 2005"
and inserting “$40,500,000 for the period of Octo er 1, 2004,

.throu h July 21, 2005".

TRAINING AND- EDUCATION. -——Sectlon 5001(a)(3) of such
Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat.

* 346) is amended by striking “$16,000,000: for the period of

October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005" and -inserting
“$16,200,000 for the period of October I, 2004, through July
21, 2605".

(4) BUREAU- OF TRANSPORTATION STATISTICS.—Section
5001(2)(4) of such Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; :119
Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346} is amended by striking “$24,800,000
for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005"
and inserting "$25,110,000 for. the permd of Octo er 1, 2004,
through July 21, 2005".

( ITS STANDARDS, RESEARCH, OPERATIONAL TESTS, AND
DEVELOPMENT.—Section' 5001{a) (5} of such Act (112 Stat. 420
118 Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat...346) is amended
striking “$88,000,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, thmugz
July 19, 2005" and inserting “$89,100, 000 for the permd of
October 1, 2004, throu E%ITJUI 21, 2005".

((33] ITS DEPLOYM gecmm 5001(a)(6) of such Act ()112
Stat. -420; 118 Stat. 1150; :119 Stat. 327; 119-Stat. 346
amended by striking.$97,600,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July .19, 2005 and inserting “$98,820,000
for the period of October 1, 2004, through. July 21, 2005".

(7) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION SEARCH.—Section
5001(a}(7) of such, Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119
Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346} is amended by striking “$21,200,000
for the perfod of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005"




" PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20; 2005 -119 STAT. 383

- and inserting “$21,465,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,

through July 21, 2005".

" (0) OPOLITAN PLANNING. uSection 5(c)(1) of the Surface
' Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1150;
119 Stat. 328; 118 Stat. 346) is amended by striking “$174,000,000
for the period of October i; 2004, through- July 19, 2005” and
* inserting “$176,175,000 for the period of October 1 2004, through
July 21, 2005”7,

(d) TERRITORIES. —-Section 1101(d)(1) of the Transportation
, .Act for the 21st’Century (112 Stat. 111; 118 Stat. 1150
. 119 tat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by strikmg *$29,120,000

for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005 and
inserting "$29,484,000 for the period of October 1 2004, through
July 21, 2005".

(e) ALASKA HIGHWAY.—Section llOl(e)(l) of such Act (118 Stat.
- 1150 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking
“$15,040,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, througﬁ July 19,
2005" and inserting £e5 228,000 for the period of October 1, 2004
,throu July 21, 2005"

. ®. OPERATION LIFESAVER.—Section llOl(ﬂ(l) of such Act (118
. Stat, 1151; 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking
“$400,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005
and inserting “$405,000 for the period of October 1, 2004 through

‘July 21, ZOOE

-+ " (g) BRIDGE DISCRETIONARY —Section 1101{g)(1) of such Act (118
Stat 1151; 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended—

: Al . {1) by striking “$80,000,000" and -inserting “$81 ,000,000";

+ an

(2) b strikirll\%m.]ulg 19" and inserting ‘July 217,
{h) INTERSTATE NTENANCE.—Section 1101{h){1) of such Act
(118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended-—
L 4 (1) by striking “$80,000,000" and inserting “$81,000,000";
an

(2) by striking “July 19 and inserti “July 21",

i) RECREATION TRAILS ADMINI TIVE COSTS —Section
1101(i}(1) of such Act (118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat.
346) is amended by strikm “$600,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through Jul 005" and insertin’g -$607.500 for the
period of October 1, 2 4 throu h July 21, 2005”.

S ) RAILWAY- HIGHWAY CROSSING HAZARD- BLIMINATION IN HIGH
SPEE RAIL CORRIDORS.—Section 1101(j)(1) of such Act (118 Stat.
- 1151; 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended—

(1) by striking $4 200,000” and inserting "$4, 252 0007

(2) by striking “$200,000" and irlserting "$202,500"; and
. 1(3% lby strikmg “July 19" each place it appears and insertlng

u

(k) NONDISCRIMINATION —Section llOI(k) of such Act (118 Stat.
1151; 119 Stat. 328; 119 Stat. 346) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1) by striking “$8,000,000 for the ‘period
of October .1, 2004, through July 19, 2005" ‘and inserting
“$8,100,000: for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
21, 2005”; and

(2) in paragraph (2) by strikmg “$8,000, 000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through July 19,-2005" and inserting

: é$1821885000 for the period of October 1 2004, through July

36




- 119 STAT. 384 PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005

. (1) ADMINISTRATION OF FUNDS.—Sectlon 5{(1) . of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act-of 2004, Part V (l 18" Stat 1151,
119 Stat. 329;-119 Stat. 346} is amended—

(1) by striking “and section 4 of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005. Part II" ‘and inserting ““section 4 of
the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part II,
and section 4 of - the Surface Transportatlon Extension Act
of 2005 Part III"; and -

{2) by striking “and sectlon 4(a) of the Surface Transpor—
tation Extension Act of 2005, Part II” and inserting “section
"4(a) of the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part
II, and section 4(a}, of the Surface: Transportatlon Extension
Act of 2005, Part II1".

(m) -REDUCTION OF ALLOCATED PROGRAMS. —Sect_ion S(m) of
such Act (118 Stat. 1151;:119 Stat. 329; 119 Stat. 346) is amended—

(1) by striking “and section 4 of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005, Part IT" and inserting: “section 4 of
the Surface Transportation Extension Act of, 2005, Part II,
and section-4 of the Surface Transportanon Extension Act
of 2005, Part 111"

. (2 by striking and section 4 of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act, Part II" the first- place it:appears and.inserting
“section 4 of the Surface Transportation lgeenswn Act, Part
I1, and section 4 of the Surface ransportation Extension Act,
Part III"; and -
: 3 b -striking * “and section 4 of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act, Part IT" the second place it appears and insertin
“, section 4 of the Surface Transportation Extension Act o
2005, Part II, and_section 4 of the Surface Transpartatiun
Extension Act, Part III".
(n) PROGRAM CATEGORY RECONCILIATION —Sectlon S(n) of such
Act (118 Stat. 1151; 119 Stat. 329; 119 Stat. 346} is amended
by strikin ﬁ “and section 4 of the Surface Transportation Extension
_ Act, Part I" and inserting *, section 4 of the-Surface Transportation
| -Extension Act of 2005, Part II, and. section 4.of the Surface
- Transportation Extension Act-Part ITI". -~ ) _

SEC 5. EXTENSION OF HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS o

(a) CHAPTER 1 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.— ,
(1) SEAT BELT SAFETY INCENTIVE GRANTS.—Section 157{(g)(1)
of title 23, United States Code, is amended by striking
“$89,600,000 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
19, 2005” and inserting “$90,720,000" for the period of ctober
1, 2004, through July 21, 2005".
-".(2).. PREVENTION OF INTOXICATED DRIVER: INCENTIVE
GRAN'I'S ~Section 163{e)(1) of such title is amended. by striking
++ “$88,000,000. for. the period of October 1, 2004, through July
19, 2005” and inserting “$89,100,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July 21, 2005".
© .+ (b) CHAPTER 4 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS. —Section 2009 (2)(1)
of the Transportation qumtsy Act for the 21st Century- (112 Stat.
.337; 118 Stat ‘1152; 119 Stat. 329; 119 Stat. 346) is amended
by striking $132,000,000 for. the period of October 1, 2004, through
. LJulzy 19, 20057.and inserting “$133,650, 000.for the perlod of October
004, through July 21, 2005".
:- " () HIGHWAY SAFETY RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT.—Section
2009{(a)(2) of such Act-{112 Stat. 337; 118 Stat. 1152; 119 Stat.

37




- PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005 © 119 STAT. 385

329; 119 Stat.:346) is .amended by striking "$57,600,000" for the
period of October 1. 2004, through July 19, 2005 and inserting
'$58, 320 000 for the period of October 1, 2004 through July 21,

- 2005". . o

(d) - OCCUPANT PROTECTION .INCENTIVE, GRANTS.—Section
2009(a)(3) of such’ Act {112 Stat. 337; 118" Stat. 1152; 119 Stat.
329; 119 Stat. 346) is' amended striking 316.000.000 for the
period of October 1, 2004, througg Jul 2005" and inserting
$16,200,000 for the period of October l 2004, through July 21,

- 20057,

(e) ALCOHOL IMPAIRED DRIVING COUNTERMEASURES INCENTIVE
GRANTS.—Section 2009(a)(4) of such Act-(112:Stat. 337; 118 Stat.
1153; 119 Stat. 329; 119 Stat. 346) 'is amended ﬁ strlkm

“$32,000,000° for the geriod of October 1, 2004, throug Julz
"2005™ and inserting “$32,400, OOG for the penod of October- 1, 2004
. throughJuly 21, 2005".

- ENA ONAL DRIVER REGISTER-—— T

(1) FUNDING.—Section 2009(a)(6) +of ‘such - Act (112 Stat.

' 338 118 Stat. 1153; 119 Stat. 330; 119 Stat. 346) is amended
tf)llrs km% “$2,880,000 for the period of October 1, 2004,
- " -through July 19, 2005” and inserting “$2,916,000 for the period
' of October I, 2004, through July 21,2005". . &
g = (2 CONTRACT - AUTHORITY. —Funds -made available by the
amendments made. by paragraph-(1) and by section 5(f) of
. the Surface Transportation Extension Act. of 2005 (119 Stat.
« " 330: 119/Stat. 346) shall -be available ‘for- cbligation in the

:+ same manner: as if such funds were appomoned under chapter
" Tof tltie 23, United States Code. -

SEC 6. FEDE'RAL MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY ADM]'NISTRATION PRO-
., .GRAM. :

- (a) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES —-Sectmn 7(2)(1) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1153
119 Stat. 330; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking “$206,037,600
- for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 19, 2005" and
‘ilnsler?ngzoggos 154,425 for the penod of October” l 2004, through

uly 21
) MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY ASSISTANCE PROGRAM.—Section
~ 31104(a)(8) of title 49 Unlted States Code is. amended to read
as follows: .
*'(8)' Not more than 3136 589 041 for the per:od of October
.1, 2004, through July 21, 2005.".
‘(c) INFORMATION S TEMS AND COMMERCIAL DRIVERS LICENSE

(l) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATION. —Section 31 107(a) {6)
of such title is amended to read as follows:

“(6) $16,164, 384 for the period of- October 1, 2004 through
July 21, 2005.”

(2) EMERGENCY CDL GRANTS. —-—Section 7(c) (2) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1153
119 Stat. 330; 119 Stat. 346) is amended— S

. (A) by striking “July 19" and inserting July 217,
{l striking “$800 000" and-inserting “$808, 219
(d} CRASH CA SATION STUDY.—Section 7(d) .of: such Act (118
Stat. 1154; 119 Stat. 330; 119 Stat. 346) is amended— - -
(l) by striking “$800,000" and inserting *$808, 219 and
{2) by striking “July 19" and inserting “July 21",

38




119 STAT. 386 . PUBLIC LAW 109-35r,—JULY 20, 2005

SEC. 7. EXTENSION OF FEDERAL TRANSIT PROGRAMS

(a) ALLOCATING AMOUNTS. —~Section 5309(m) of title 49, United
States Code, is amended—
G, (1) in the matter preceding subparagraph {A) of paragraph
(1) by striking “July 19, 2005" and inserting “July 21, 2005™;
é) in A}.)aragraph (2)(B) (ii)—. -
in the heading by stnking "JULY 18, 2005" and
Anserting “JULY 21, 2005";
(B) by striking “$8, 320, 000 and inserting '$8,424,0007;
and
(UC) by striking .Iuly 19 2005 "and inserting “July
21,2
(3) in A)aragraph 3)(B ’
) by striking $2 400, 000 and inserting '$2, 430 000";

(B) by striking .Iuly I9 2005 and. inserting “July
21,2005 and © .}
(4) in Avaragraph (3)(C)— '
striking $40 000, 000" and inserting
$40 500, 000 and
L {Bg by striking July 19, 2005” and inserting “July
21, 2005",
1(b)’ FORMULA GRANTS AUTHORIZATIONS. —Section 5338(a) of title
49, United States Code, is amended--
(1) in the heading to- parasgraph (2) by striking “JULY 19,
2005" and inserting “JULY 21, 200
2 m l{)aragraph (2HA) (vii)— -

3/ striking “$2,675,300,000" and inserting
32 793 483,000"

- (B) by strikmg “July 19; 2005” and inserting “July
21, 2005™;

o (3 in paragraph (2)(B)(vu) by striking *July 19, 2005"
and inserting “July 21, 2005"; and

' (4) in-.paragr agh (2)(C) by striking July 19, 2005" and

insertin J?lly 005"

(c) FORMULA GRANT FUNDS.—Section B(d) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V' (118 Stat. 1155;
119 Stat. 331: 119 Stat. 346) is amended—
oY 1) Inthe heading by striking * JULY 19, 2005" and inserting

“JULY 21, 2005™;

"7 (2) in the matter preceding para raph (1) by strikmg ‘July

19, 2(%()]5 and insertllln )Jul y 21, 2 §$ 8 0

- in paragraph. (1) by striking “$3,879,960" and insertin:

“*333)8453 AT ——

in para a h 2 striking “$40,000,000” and insertin

340(5;)00 i () Y & 8

5 inpara raph (3) by striking “$76,231,201" and insertin

"“$79,052,761" eTap Y & &
7 8) in paragraph {4) by striking “$202, 330,313" . and

inser(t_{i)ng “$209,819, 20(3)

in paragraph (5) by strikin “$5,560, 000" and insertin,

“$5,629,500™; ar%ﬁ Y & &

) (8) in paragraph (ﬁ) by strlkmg “$2,897,738,526" and
. msertmﬁ“‘$3 ,004,993,077",

(d) CAPITAL PROGRAM AIHHORIZATIONS ——Section 5338(b)(2) of
title 49, United States Code, is aménded—

39




" PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005 “119 STAT. 387

F

(1) in the heading by striking ‘JULY 19, 2005” and inserting
“JULY 21, 2005";
(2) in subparagraph (A){vii)—
gf striking  “$2,235,820,000" and inserting
“$2, 263 265,142"; and
(B) by striking “July 19, 2005 and inserting “July
21, 2005"; and -
‘ (3) in sub ara, aph {B)(vii) by striking “July 19, 2005"
 and inserting "July 21, 2008"
(e) PLANNING = AUTHORIZATIONS AND ALLOCATIONS —Section
© 5338(c)(2) of title 49, United States Code. is amended—
(1) in the heading by striking JULY 19 2005 and inserting
“JULY 21, 2005";
(2) in subparagraph (A} (vii)—
A} by = striking "$47,946, 667 and inserting
“$48,546,727"; and’
) by striking "July 19, 2005” and inserting “July
21, 2005"; and
(3) in su Rara%raph (B) (Vil) by striking "July 19, 2005"
and insertin 1,2
(f)y RESEARCH A ORIZATIONS -—Section 5338(d)(2) of title 49,
United States Code, is amended—
(1) in the heading by striking ° JULY 19, 2005 and msertmg
“JULY 21, 2005™; o .
(2) insubparagraph (A)( )—»
A) by = striking - "$36, 933, 334 ' and inserting
“$37,385,434"; and
(B) by strikmg “Juiy 19, 2005 and inserting “July
21, 2005™;
(3) in sub ara%raph (B)(Vil) by striking July 19, 2005"
and inserting “July 21, 2005"; and
{4 in subparag gh (C) by. striking ".Iuly 19, 2005" and
inserting “Jul
. ALLOCATION OF RESEARCH' FUNDS —Sectiori 8(h) of the Sur-
face Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1156;
119 Stat. 332; 119 Stat. 346} is amended—
(1) in the heading by striking “JULY 19, 2005 and 1nserting
“JULE?.)Zil 2?105" ed h (1).b ki Jul
: n the matter preceding paragrap stri ng “July
19, 2005" and inserting "July 281 200 gr Y
"$4 2(g)2 in. garag-raph 1) by striking “$4,200,000” and mserting

“$6, 682 5
(5) in g)aragraph (3)— .
) by striking “$3,200,000" and insertlng '$3,240,000";

Ogaragraph (2) by striking “$6,600, 000 and inserting

and
l'l[)'¥ “$800, 600" and inserting. “$810,000",
(h) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH AUTHORIZATIONS.—
Section 5338(e){2) of title 49, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in the heading by striking "JULY 19, 2005" and inserting
“JULY 21, 2005";
(2} in subpara raph {A)—
| A) by striking “$4,000,000" and inserting “$4,060,000™;
an
T {B) b striking “July 19, 2005 and inserting . “Jul
21, 2005":y 8 Y ' T 8 Y

40




"119 STAT. 388 PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20,’2005

{3} in subpar graph (B) by striking. “July 19, 2005” and
inserting “Jul 005"; and

(4) in su paragraphs (C) @) and (C}(iii) by striking “July
19, 2005” and insertin, 21, 200
(i) ALLOCATION OF E%SITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH

- (1) IN GENERAL. —Section 8() of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1157:,-119 Stat. 332;
119 Stat. 346) is amended—

(A) in the matter preceding sub aragraph (A) of para-
%ragh (1) by striking July 18, ZOOg and: mserting July

005";

B) in para; raph (1)(A) by striking “$1, 600 600" and

“la inserting “$1,6 g

(C) in para raph (1)(B) by striking “$1 600 000" and
inserting “$1,620,000";
D) in paragraph (2) by striking Juiy 19, 2005" and

. insertin 21, 2005".

o -: {2) COl ORM G AMENDMENT —Section 3015(d)(2) of the

5o Transportation Equity Act for.the .21st Century (49 U.S.C.
5338 note; 112 Stat. 857; 118 Stat. 1157; {19 Stat 332; 119
~ Stat. 346) is amended by striking “July 19, 2005 and inserting

July 21, 2005".

LSD MINISTRATION AUTHORIZATIONS. -—Section 5338(f) (2) of title

49, United States Code, is amended— -

(1} in the heading by striking “JULY 19 2005 -and insertlng

"JULY 21, 2605"; .

{2) in subparagraph (A) (vil)— T,
A} by ' striking. “$52,000, 000 and. inserting
“$52 780,000"; and
(B) - by striklng "July 19, 2005 and insertmg "July
21 2005"; and
. (3) in subparagraph {B)(vii) by striking July 19, 2005”

and insertm(g ‘July 21, 2005"

(k) JOB ACCESS AND 'REVERSE COMMUTE PROCRAM -——Section
3037(1). of the Transportation Equity Act for. the 21st Century (49
U.S.C. 5309 note; 112 Stat. 391; 118" Stat. 1157 119 Stat.” 333;
119 Stat. 346} is amended— - G- T

(1) in paraﬁraph (DA (vii)—.
- striking $80 000, 000 and R ,inserting
"$81,027. 500 and -
®B) by striking “July 19 2005 and inserting “July
2.1 2005™;
(2} in paragraph (l)(B)(wi) by stnking Juiy 19, 2005
and inserting “July 21, 2005™; and
(3) in para; raph (2) by stnkin July 19 2005 not more
;iii;anogfcim 030 ,000" and inserting “Ju y 21 2005 not more- than
1 .
(1) - RURAL 'I'RANSPORTATION ACCESSIBILI’I'Y INCEN'I'IVE PRO-
GRAM.--Section 3038(g) of the Transportation Equity. Act for the
. 21st Century (49 U.S.C. 5310 note; 112 Stat.. 393 1 8 Stat. 1158;
119 Stat. 333 119 Stat. 346) is amended—
(1) by strikmg paragra h (1){(G} and inserting the following:
(G) $4,222,125 for the period of October 1, "2004,
through July 21, 2005."; and -
{2} in paragraph (2)— - Lo

41.




«PUBLIC LAW.109-35—JULY 20, 2005 119 STAT. 389

{A) by:striking “$1,360,000" and inserting "S 1,407,3757;
and
((I)B&Sby striking July 19, 2005” and inserting “July
21,2
~.(m) URBANIZED AREA FORMULA GRANTS. —Section 5307(h)(2)
of title 49, United States Code, is amended—
T (1) in the heading by striking JULY 18, 2005 and inserting
*JULY 21,.2005"; and
(2} in subpa raph (A} by str'iking July 19 2005" and
“insertin G05".
. .{n) OBL ATIO CEILING ——Section 3040(7) of the Transportation
Equity Act for the 21st Century (112 Stat. 394 118 Stat. 1158;
119 Stat. 333; 119 Stat. 346) is amended——
(1) by striking $6 166,400, 000" and inserting
$6,229,759,760"; and
005(2) by stnkmg "July 19 2005 and inserting “July 21,
2
(o) FUEL CELL BUS AND BUS FACILITIES PROGRAM.—Section
' 3015(b) of the Transportation Equity Act for the Z2lst Century
{112 Stat. 361; !18 tat. 1158; 119 Stat. 333; 119 Stat. 346) is
amended—- .
(1) by strlking “July 19, 2005" and mserting ‘July 21,
2005"; and
(Z)b striking “$3,880,000" and insertin “$3, 928 500,
(p) ADVANCED TECHNOLOGY PILOT PROJECT. —Sectjon 3015(&:) (2)
- ‘of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century (49 U.S.C. 23 USC 322 note.
322 note; 112 Stat. 361; 118 Stat (1158; 119 Stat 334 119 Stat.
346) is amended—
SR (1- by striking “July 19 2005 " and inserting “July 21,
2005”; and
' (2) striking “$4,000,000” and insertm *$4,050,000",
q) PROJECTS FOR NEW FIXED GUIDEWAY SYSTEMS AND EXTEN-
. SIONS TO EXISTING SYSTEMS.—Subsections (a), (b). and (c}(1) of
section 3030 of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st’Century
" (112 Stat.-373; 118 Stat 1158; 119 Stat. 334; 119 Stat. 346) are
.- amended E%stnkmg Rg 19, 2065" and inserting “July 21, 2005".
' o N JERSEY URBAN CORE PROJECT.—Subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C} of section 3031(z}{3) of the  Intermodal Surface
Transportation Efficiency Act of 1991 (105 Stat. 2122; 118 Stat.
.+ 1158; 119 Stat. 334; 119 Stat. 346) are amended by striking “July
18, 2005" and inserting "July 21, 2005".

. .+ (s) LOCAL SHARE. —Section 301 l(a) of the Transportatlon Equit
Act for the 21st Century (49 U.S.C. 5307 note; 118 Stat. 1158;
"119 Stat. '334; 119 Stat. 346) is amended by striking Ju!y 19,

2005" and msertmg ‘July 21,-2005".

" 'SEC. 8. SPORT FISHING AND BOATING SAFETY.

(a) FUNDING FOR NATIONAL OUTREACH AND COMMUNICATIONS
PROGRAM.—Section 4(c)(7) of the Dingell-Johnson Sport Fish Res-
‘toration Act (16 U.S.C. 777c{c)) is amended to read as follows:

“(7) $8, 099 997 for the period of October i, 2004 thruugh

July 21, 2005

(b) CLEAN VESSEL ACT FUNDING.—Sectior 4(b)(4) of such Act
(16 U.S.C. 777¢{b)(4)) is amended to read as follows:

“(4) FIRST 42 WEEKS OF FISCAL YEAR 2005.—For 'the period
of October 1, 2004, through July 21, 2005, of the balance

42




- 119 STAT: 390 ., .PUBLIC,LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005

26 USC 9503.

+ . of each annual appropriation remaining after making the dis-
- tribution under subsection (a), an amount equal to $66,420,000,
reduced by 82.9 percent .of the amount appropriated for that
fiscal ‘year -from the Boat Safety Account of the Agquatic
. Resources Trust Fund established by- section 9504 of the
‘. .Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to carry out the purposes of
section 13106{(a) of title 46, United States Code, shall be used

as follows: o -
. -« - -"(A) $8,100,000 shall be available to the Secretary of
.~ .the Interior for 3 fiscal 6years for obligation for gualified
. projects under section 5604{c) of the Clean Vessel Act of

- 1992 (33 U.S.C. 1322 note). ’ }

“(B) $6,480,000 shall be available to the Secretary of
the Interior for 3 fiscal years for obligation for qualified
grojects under section 7404(d}) of the Sportfishing and

oating Safety Act of 1998 (16 U.S.C. 777g-1(d)).
oo (,B) The balarice remaining after the application of
, subpara%raphs_ (A) and (B) shall be transferred to the Sec-
. retary of Transportation ‘and shall be expended for State
recreational boating ‘safeéydg)rograms under section 13106
. . of title 46, United States. e et
() BOAT SAFETY FUNDS.—Section 13106(c) of title 46, United
States Code, isamended— , = - T e
%l; by striking "$4,000,000" and inserting “$4.050,000"; and
2) by striking “$1,600,000" and inserting "$1,620,003".

SEC. 9..EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATION FOR USE OF TRUST FUNDS
* FOR OBLIGATIONS UNDER TEA-21. . o

(a) HIGHWAY TRUST FUND.—* - - o '
‘(1) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section-9503(c) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— :
(A) in the mattér before su’braragr’a h (A), by striking
© “July 20, 2005 and inserting “July 22, 2005"; .
(B} by striking “or” at the-end of subparagraph (L);
(C) by striking the.peried at the end of subparagraph
(M) and inserting ", or”; - . :
(D) by inserting after subparagraph' (M} the following
- new subparagraph: oo :
“(N) authorized to be .paid out of the Highway Trust
- Fund under the Surface Transportation Extension Act of
2005, Part I1L"; and .o L
(E) in the matter after subparagraph (N), as added
I%);‘ this paragraph, by striking “Surface Transportation
tension Act of 2005, Part ﬁ and inserting “Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part II1".
(2) SS TRANSIT ACCQUNT.—Paragraph (3) of section
9503(e) of such Code is amended—
(A} in the matter before subparagraph (A), by striking
“July 20, 2005 and inserting “July 22, 20057;
(B) in subpara%'aph (J), by striking “or” at the end
of such subparagraph;
{(C) in subparagraph (K), by inserting “or” at the end
of such subparagraph;
{D) by inserting after subparagraph (K) the following
new subparagraph:
“(L) the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2005,
Part HI1,”; and

43




- PUBLIC LAW 108-35—JULY 20, 2005 '119 STAT. 391

(E) in the matter after subparagraph (L), as added

Iéy this paragraph, by strikinﬁ- “Surface Transportation

xtension Act of 2005, Part II” and inserting “Surface

Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part III”, -

(3) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION. ON TRANSFERS.—Subpara-
graph (B) of section 9503(b}(6) of such Code is amended by
striking “July 20, 2005" and inserting “July 22, 2005™
(b} AQUATIC QURCES TRUST FUND.— v

(1) SPORT FISH RESTORATION ACCOUNT.—Paragraph (2) of
section 9504(b) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 Is 26 USC9504.
amended by striking “Surface. Transportation Extension Act
of 2005, Part II" each place it appears and inserting “Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part I1I".

(2) BOAT SAFETY ACCOUNT.—Subsection (c} of section 9504
of such Code is amended— -

{A) by striking “July*20, 2005" and inserting “July
22, 2005”7, and 3 oL
. {B) by striking “Surface Transportation Extension Act
~of 2005, Part 1" and inserting “Surface Transportation
Extensidn Act of 2005, Part 111", . '
_ {3). EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON TRANSFERS.—Paragraph
(2} of section 9504{d) of such Code is amended by striking
“July 20, 2005 and inserting “July 22, 2005". LT
. {c) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section 26 USC 9503
shall take effect on the date of the enactment of this Act. note.
: (d) TEMPORARY RULE REGARDING ADJUSTMENTS.—During the
period beginning on the date of the:enactment of the Surface
Transportation ension Act of 2003 and-ending on July 21, 2005,
for purposes of making any estimate under section 9503(d) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 of receipts of the Highway Trust . . . -

. . Fund, the Secretary of the Treasury shall treat—

(1) each expiring provision of paragraphs (1) through (4)
.. of section 950;@) of such Code which is related to appropria-
- tions or transfers to such Fund to have been extended through
the end of the 24-month period referred to in section
9503(d) (1) (B) of such Code; and -

(2) with respect to each tax impesed . under the sections
referred to in section 9503(b)(1) of such Code, the rate of such
tax during .the 24-monith period referred to in section
9503((1)(1)(%) of such Code to be the same as the rate of such

44




119 STAT. 392 - PUBLIC LAW 109-35—JULY 20, 2005

tax as in effect on the date of the enactment of the Surface
Transpertation Extension Act of 2003.

Approved July 20, 2005.

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY-—H.R. 3332:

oo CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 151 (2005):
) July 189, considered and passed House and Senate.

45




119 STAT. 410 PUBLIC LAW 109-40-—JULY 28, 2005

July 28, 2005

[H.R. 3453)

2005, Part V.
23 USC 101 note.

23 USC 104 note.

Public Law 10940
109th Congress
An Act

To provide an extension of highway, highway safety, motor carrier safety, transit,
and other programs funded out of the Highway Trust Fund pending enactment
of a 1aw reauthorizing the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Surface Transportation Extension
Act of 2005, Part V™.

SEC. 2. ADVANCES.

(a} IN GENERAL.—Section 2(a)(1) of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2004, Part V (23 U.S.C. 104 note; 118 Stat,
1144; 119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394)
is amended by striking “and the Surface Transportation Extension
Act of 2005, Part and inserting “the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005, Part IV, and the Surface Transportation
Extension Act of 2005, Part V™.

(b) PROGRAMMATIC DISTRIBUTIONS.~—

(1) SPECIAL RULES FOR MINIMUM GUARANTEE.—Section
2(b)(4) of such Act (119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat.
379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended by striking “$2,301,370,400"
and inserting “$2,324,000,000".

(2) EXTENSION OF OFF-SYSTEM BRIDGE SETASIDE.—Section
144{gX3) of title 23, United States Code, is amended by striking
“July 27" and inserting “July 30",

(¢) AUTHORIZATION OF CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Section
1101(1X1) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(118 Stat. 1145; 119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119
Stat. 394) is amended by striking “$27,968,968,718 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through dJuly 27, 2005" and inserting
;%282,33535990,320 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July

(d) LIMITATION ON OBLIGATIONS.—Section 2(e) of the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1146;
119 Stat. 324; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is
amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking “July 27" and inserting “July 30”;

(B) by striking “and the Surface Transportation Exten-
sion Act of 2005,  Part IV” and inserting “the Surface
Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part IV, and the
Su(li'face Transportation Extension Act of 2005, Part V7;
an

46




PUBLIC LAW 109-40--JULY 28, 2005 119 STAT. 411

(C) by striking “82.2 percent” and msertlng “83 per-
cent”; and . )
(2)in A)aragraph (2)—
striking “July 27 2005 shaﬂ ‘not  exceed
$28,520 554 600" and inserting “July 30, 2005, shall not
exceed $28,801,000,000”; and ,
(B) by striking “$525,205,602" and inserting
“$530,370,0007; and \
“Ju1(3) in paragraph (3) by striking “July 27” and inserting

SEC 3. ADMINISTRATIVE -ENS'ES

Section 4(a) of the Surface Transportation Extenmon Act of
2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1147; 119 Stat 325; 119 Stat. 346; 119
Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended by atnkmg “$289, 334 8627
and inserting “$292,179,920”.

SEC. 4. OTHER FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAY PROGRAMS.
{a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIA’I’IONS UNDER TITLE I OF TEA-

(1) FEDERAL LANDS HIGHWAYS o
(A) INDIAN RESERVATION ROADS. —-Semon 1101(a}X8XA)
. of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
{112 Stat, 112 118 Stat. 1147; 119 Stat. 325; 119 Stat.

346; 119 Stat. 379 119 Stat. 394)lBa.mended—

(i) in the first sentence by striking “$226,027,450
. for the period of October 1, 2004, through July 27,
., . -2005" and inserting “$228, 250,000 for the “period of
. - October 1, 2004, through July 30 20057; and
(ii) in the 'second sentence by striking
“$10,684,934” and inserting “$10,790,000".
(B) PUBLIC LANDS HIGHWAYS.—Section 1101(aX8XB) of

such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 325;

119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended

nkn:f «$202,191,828 for the period of Octobér 1, 2004,

uly 27, 2005” and inserting “$204,180, OGO for
enod of October 1, 2004, through July 30 2005”.
C) PARK ROADS AND PARKWAYS. —éectmn 1101(a)8XC)

of such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 325;

119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379 119 Stat. 394) is amended

tgrgtnkmf “$135,616,470 for the period of October 1, 2004,

h ugh 217, 2005” and mserting “$136,950, 000 for

ricd of October 1, -2004, - through July 30 2005,
) REFUGE ROADS.—Section 1101(a)(8)(D) of such Act

(112 Stat. 112; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326; 119 Stat.

346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended b striking

“$16,438,360 for the -period of October 1, 2004 through

July 27, 2005” and inserting “$16,600, 000 for the period

~ of October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005”.

(2) NATIONAL CORRIDOR PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT AND
COORDINATED BORDER INFRASTRUCTURE PROGRAMS.—Section
1101a}9) of such Act (112 Stat. 112; 118.Stat. 1148; 119
Stat. 326; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat.. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is

¢  amended b striking “$115 068,520 for the period of:October
.+ 1, 2004, through July 27, 2005” and msertmg “$116,200,000
for the élenod of October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005”.

{3) CONSTRUCTION OF FERRY BOATS AND FERRY TERMINAL

FACILITIES.— .

47




119 STAT. 412 " PUBLIC-LAW 109-40—JULY 28, 2005

(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 1101(a)(10) of such Act (112
Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119‘Stat. 326; 119 Stat. 346;
119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended.by striking
“$31.932,884 for the period of October 1, 2004, through
-July 27, 2005” and’ inserting “$31,540,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005”.-

(B) SET ASIDE FOR ALASKA, NEW JERSEY, AND WASH-
INGTON.—Section 5(a)}3XB) of the Surface Transportation
Extension Act-of 2004, Part V (118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat.
326; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is
amended— e "

(i). in clause (i) by striking “$8,219,180" and
inserting “$8,300,000”; ‘ : ,

(i), in_clause (i) by striking “$4,109,590” and
inserting “$4,150,000”; and . T

(iii) in clause (iii) by striking “$4,109,590” and
N inserting “$4,150,000”. : - -

. {4) NATIONAL ~SCENIC BYWAYS PROGRAM.—Section
1101(a)11) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Cen-
tury (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119- Stat.’ 326; 119 Stat.
346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 -Stat. -394) is amended by striking
“$21,780,827 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
27, 2005” and inserting’ “$21,995,000 for the period of October
1, 2004, through July 30, 2605”. ' SooE

© {5} VALUE PRICING PILOT ‘PROGRAM.—Section 1101(2X12)
‘of Buch' Act (112. Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119 Stat. 326;
119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended by
striking “$9,041,098 for the period of October 1, 2004, through
July 27, 2005” and 'inserting “$9,130,000 for the period of
October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005". B
(6) BIGHWAY . USE TAX EVASION PROJECTS.—Section
"1101{aX14) of such Act (112 Stat. 113; 118 Stat. 1148; 119
Stat. 326: 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is
amended by striking “$4,109,590 for the period of October 1,
- 2004, throu{gh_July 27, 2005” and inserting “$4,150,000 for
the period of October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005”.
. - (') COMMONWEALTH OF PUERTO RICO HIGHWAY PROGRAM.—
- . Section 1101¢a)15) of the Transportation Equity Act for the
. 21st Century.(112 Stat..113; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat. 326;
. 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended
- striking “$90,410,980 for the period of October 1, 2004, throug!
July 27, 2005” and inserting “$91,300,000 for the period of
October 1,,2004, through July 30, 2005, :

- (8) SAFETY -GRANTS.—Section 1212(GX1XD) of such Act (23

‘1.8.C. 402 note; 112 -Stat: 196; 112 Stat. 840; 118 Stat. 1149;

© 119 Stat. 326; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394)

is amended by striking “$410,959 for the period of October

-1, 2004, through July 27, 2005” and inserting “$415,000 for
+ the period of October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005”.

R (9) TRANSPORTATION AND COMMUNITY ' AND. SYSTEM

PRESERVATION PILOT PROGRAM.—Section 1221(e)(1) of such Act

(28 U.S.C. 101 note;'112 Stat. 223; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat.

327: 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379; 119 Stat. 394) is amended

.. by striking: “$20,547,950 for the period of October 1, 2004,

+* .+ through July 27, 2005” and inserting “$20,750,000 for the period
of October 1, 2004, through July 30, 2005”. o

48-




PUBLIC LAW 109-40--JULY 28, 2005 119 STAT. 413

T (10) TRANSPORTATION: INFRASTRUCTURE. FINANCE AND
. INNOVATION.—Section 188 of title 23, United States Code, is
amended—
(A) in subsectlon (a)(l) by striking . subparagraph (e)]
and inserting the following:
“G) $107,900,000 -for the period of October 1, 2004,
.. through July 30, 2005.™ .
. (B) in subsectlonw(a)(Z) by stnkmg “$1,643,836 for the
period of October 1, 2004, through July 27, 2005” and
-~ inserting_“$1,660,000 for the periad of October 1, 2004,
- through July. 30, 2005” ‘and. -
(C) in the item . relatmg to fiscal year 2005 in table
. contained in subsection (c) by stnkmg “$2,136,986,800”
.and inserting “$2,158,000,000”,
. (11) NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS CLEARINGHOUSE.—Section
1215(bX3) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 215t Century
. ..(112 Stat. 210; 118 Stat. 1148;.119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat 346;
.. 119 Stat. 379;. 119 Stat..394) is amended—
(4) by striking “$1 232, 877” and msemng “$1, 245 000”

and
' (B) by striking “July 27" and msertmg “July 30”.

TEA(b) AUTHORIZATION oF APPROPRIATIONS UNDER TITLE V OF
-21.—
" (1) ' 'SURFACE’ .TRANSPORTATION ° RESEARCH. —Sectmn
‘5001(aX1) of the Transportation Equity Act for the 215t Century
(112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346;
119 Stat. 379 119 Stat. 394) is amended by stnkmg
“$84 657,564 for the period- of October 1, 2004, through July
27, 2005” and inserting “$85,490,000 for the penod of October
1, 2004 through July 30, 2005”

g (2)  TBCHNOLOGY = DEPLOYMENT- PROGRAM,—Section
5001(aX2) of such Act (112 Stat. 419; 118 Stat. 1149; 119
Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346; 119 "Stat. 379 119 Stat.: 394) is

- amended by striking “$41 095,900 for the -period of October
1,' 2004, through- July 27, 2005” and inserting “$41,500,000
for the penod of October 1, 2004, through July: 30 2005”.
+* '(3) TRAINING AND EDUCATION.—Section 5001(a}(3) of such
Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327;.119 Stat.

_ 346; 119 Stat. 379 119 Stat. 394) is amended by striking

- “$16,438,360 for the period of October 1, 2004, through July
27, 2005” and ingerting “$16,600,000 for the penod of October
1, 2004 through July 30, 2005”

."(4) BUREAU OF TRANSPORTATION. STATISTICS.—Section
5001(a}4) of such Act (112 Stat. 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119
Stat. 327; 119 Stat. .346; 119 Stat. 379 119  Stat. 394) is
-amended b striking “$25 479,458 for the . period ‘of October

= 1, 2004, through July 27, 2005” and inserting “$25,730,000

- for the ﬁ‘gxod of October '1; 2004, through July 30, 2005".
STANDARDS, RESEARCH, OPERATIONAL TESTS, AND

-DEVELOPMENT —Section 5001(a)5) of such Act (112 Stat, 420;
118 Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346; 119 Stat. 379

=1 119 Stat..394) is amended by striking “$90,410,980 for the

Benod .of October 1, 2004, t.hrough July 27, 2005” and inserting
3%9%33&000 for the penod of October 1, 2004, through July

(6) ITS DEPLOYMENT.—Section 5001(a}(6) of such Act (112

.Stat 420; 118 Stat. 1150; 119 Stat. 327; 119 Stat. 346; 119

49




